Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2020 9:49 AM
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Here is the record of the cart delivery.

Cs

From: Young, Susan (CI-StPaul) <Susan.Young@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, March 9, 2020 10:04 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Greg:
Mr. Carlson’s address is 542 Ohio.
susan

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, March 9, 2020 9:38 AM

To: Young, Susan (CI-StPaul) <Susan.Young@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Haas, Sarah (CI-StPaul) <Sarah.Haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Susan,
Please see request from Frances.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>
Sent: Monday, March 9, 2020 9:29 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Chris,
Could you please provide me the address to this location so that | can make the change.

Thank you



Frances Estrella
Billing Coordinator

4325 66" St E

Inver Grove Heights, Mn 55076
e festrella@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4588

w RepublicServices.com
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We'll handle it from herel

From: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 5:51 PM

To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>
Subject: FW: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Frances,

Please read below and schedule. Thank you

Romack Franklin
Municipal Services Manager
Greater St. Paul Area

4325 E. 66 Street

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e rfranklin3@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4575 ¢ 612-300-7497
w www.republicservices.com
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We'll handle it from here

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, March 05, 2020 4:42 PM

To: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Subject: FW: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court




Note that (grevering.sph@gmail.com) is an external email. Report suspicious emails by clicking on “Report
Phishing"

Romack,
Please see cart delivery request.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2020 4:26 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Romack,

Please have 4 small every other week carts delivered to Mr. Carlson property. His medium carts are located behind the
garage in the public parking lot.

Thank you,

Cs

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, March 3, 2020 10:42 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Romack,
| called and left Mr. Carlson a message.

Cs

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 3:09 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see Romack’s request below.

Greg Revering

Chief Manager



St. Paul Haulers LLC.
grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 3:04 PM

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Mr. Carlson - Conciliation Court

Chris,

Can you please give Mr. Carlson a call back about his carts.

Romack Franklin
Municipal Services Manager
Greater St. Paul Area

4325 E. 66" Street

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e rfranklin3@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4575 ¢ 612-300-7497
w www.republicservices.com
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We'll handle it from here.”



