Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 1:36 PM
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Received and removed!
Clare, please remove the Q4 2019 assessment.

Cs

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 1:12 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Here you go 297 Bates Ave

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Nawodi, Manteza <MNawodi@republicservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 1:11 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

Oh sorry
297 Bates Ave

Manteza Nawodi
Billing Coordinator

4325 66th St E

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e mnawodi@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4569
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We'll handle it from here!

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 1:07 PM

To: Nawodi, Manteza <MNawodi@republicservices.com>
Subject: FW: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

Note that (grevering.sph@gmail.com) is an external email. Report suspicious emails by clicking on “Report
Phishing"

What address?

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 12:31 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

What address?

Cs

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 12:10 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see below.



Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Nawodi, Manteza <MNawodi@republicservices.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 2, 2020 12:08 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>
Cc: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>

Subject: Remove Q4 2019 Assessment

Greg
Please can you remove the assessment of $4.80 payment and debit memo was crossed
Thank you

Manteza Nawodi
Billing Coordinator

4325 66th St E

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e mnawodi@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4569
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We'll handle it from herel



