Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 12:14 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 1641 THOMAS AVENUE- (Q3 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 12:14 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 1641 THOMAS AVENUE- (Q3 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see update from Kim.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Kim Shannon <Kim.Shannon@advanceddisposal.com>

Sent: Friday, March 20, 2020 11:45 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Julie Miron <Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com>
Cc: Jim Smith <Jim.Smith@advanceddisposal.com>

Subject: RE: 1641 THOMAS AVENUE- (Q3 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Payment was received 8/1/19

Thank you

Kim Shannon | Operations Support/Administrative Assistant

P R—m

309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN 55103

T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552 | E: kim.shannon@AdvancedDisposal.com
Connect with us: AdvancedDisposal.com Facebook YouTube

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2020 3:50 PM
To: Kim Shannon <Kim.Shannon@advanceddisposal.com>; Julie Miron <Julie.Miron@advanceddisposal.com>

1



Cc: Jim Smith <Jim.Smith@advanceddisposal.com>
Subject: FW: 1641 THOMAS AVENUE- (Q3 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Kim,
Please see request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2020 3:33 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 1641 THOMAS AVENUE- (Q3 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Please forward to Advanced Disposal

Property Address & PID:1641 THOMAS AVENUE (PID: 332923110212)

Property Owner: Kathleen M Prock

Phone Number or Email: 651-646-7069

Pending Assessment Amount: $3.52

Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Late Fee 1 month, Small Weekly Cart Service; Oct 1-Dec 31 2019

Summary of Issue: Property owner stated that they paid the July invoice was paid on July 29, 2019 for $70.34. Can you
confirm when the payment was received and processed.

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

DY

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.




