Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (Cl-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, February 28, 2020 2:42 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

1153 Payne Ave

Amended RES by Mai Vang

Amount to abate from 2020 Taxes is 98.58 which the Assessment Office will do.
File No CG1903D2

Asmt No 190134

Ratified 11/13/2019

Tanya J Panzer

Assessment Technician

Office of Financial Services

15 W Kellogg Blvd, Suite 700

7" Floor City Hall, Saint Paul MN 55102

M: 651-266-8858 D: 651-266-6153 F: 651-266-8541
Assessment Look Up — www.stpaul.gov/assessments

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, February 28, 2020 1:32 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

For your question on 1153 Payne, are we talking about Q1 2019, Q2 2019, and Q3 2019, correct?

If that is the case, we would only need to remove Q2 2019. The Q3 2019 assessment was recommended for removal at
the last legislative hearing.

Thank you!

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, February 28,2020 11:21 AM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

| don’t know about 1153 Payne. | include Clare in this email to respond.
Mai

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 4:09 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

See my Comments in Green.



Tanya J Panzer

Assessment Technician

Office of Financial Services

15 W Kellogg Blvd, Suite 700

7" Floor City Hall, Saint Paul MN 55102

M: 651-266-8858 D: 651-266-6153 F: 651-266-8541
Assessment Look Up — www.stpaul.gov/assessments

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 4:01 PM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

See below.

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Friday, February 21, 2020 10:21 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
<joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Please Draft Motion to Abate for Levied Assessments

Hello Mai,
Could you do a motion to abate for the following two properties when you return?
1153 Payne Avenue: This is in regards to removing a Quarter 2 2019 assessment. This was set up with a UDRF in Q1

2019 and should not have been billed during this time. The resident has moved in with his daughter (the caller) and the
property is currently sitting vacant. Can | still able to do a RES to abate from the 2019 Property Taxes?

He has Q1 $96.08, Q2 $96.08, Q3 $96.08 on his taxes. Are we only abating Q2?

249 Erie Street — This is in regards to removing a Quarter 1 2019 assessment. Resident was making payments to old
Waste Management Account. These payments were transferred to current account.

Can | still able to abate from 2019 Property taxes?

There is nothing to Abate from the Taxes. Q1 was - Remove charge per Council Minutes on 10/2/2019 (RLH TA 19-731).

Thank you! Let me know if you need anymore information regarding these two assessments.

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
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The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica




www.stpaul.gov/garbage




