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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 10:01 AM
To: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment

Thanks all! 
 

Travis Bistodeau 
Deputy Director 
Department of Safety and Inspections
Pronouns: he/him/his 
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220 
Saint Paul, MN 55101 
P: 651-266-1922 
C: 651-262-7698 
F: 651-266-1919 
travis.bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America  

DSI’s Mission: To preserve and improve the quality of life in Saint Paul by protecting and promoting public health and 
safety for all. 
 

From: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 9:15 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul) <Travis.Bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
 
THANK YOU! 
 

 

Matt Dornfeld 
DSI - Case Manager 
375 Jackson St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-1902 
F: 651-266-1919 
matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

  

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America  

DSI’s Mission: To preserve and improve the quality of life in Saint Paul   
by protecting and promoting public health and safety for all. 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 9:13 AM 
To: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) 
<joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul) <Travis.Bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
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I can do this for March 11 public hearing. 
 
Mai 
 

From: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 8:34 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul) <Travis.Bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
 
Hi Mai, The PO would like to know exactly when this will be deleted, do you have a date I could share with them. 
THANKS! 
 

 

Matt Dornfeld 
DSI - Case Manager 
375 Jackson St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-1902 
F: 651-266-1919 
matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

  

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America  

DSI’s Mission: To preserve and improve the quality of life in Saint Paul   
by protecting and promoting public health and safety for all. 
 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 8:07 AM 
To: Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul) 
<Travis.Bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
 
I do the Resolution to delete after Council. 
 

From: Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 2, 2020 7:44 AM 
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Bistodeau, Travis (CI-StPaul) 
<Travis.Bistodeau@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
 
Mai this has already been assessed. How do we get this deleted? I have never written a resolution to delete. 
 
Joe 
 

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 9:32 AM 
To: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Sheffer, Vicki (CI-StPaul) 
<vicki.sheffer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
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A Resolution to delete will need to be done for this fee was Ratified on 2/19/2020. 
 
File No VB2005 
Asmt No 208804 
 
Thanks,  
 
Tanya J Panzer 
Assessment Technician 
Office of Financial Services 
15 W Kellogg Blvd, Suite 700 
7th Floor City Hall, Saint Paul MN 55102 
M: 651-266-8858 D: 651-266-6153 F: 651-266-8541 
Assessment Look Up – www.stpaul.gov/assessments 
 

From: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 9:29 AM 
To: Sheffer, Vicki (CI-StPaul) <vicki.sheffer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; 
Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1553 Lafond Ave - VB fee assessment 
 
Hello. 
This was a confusing one that we opened this past July 2019 and then closed in October 2019…The assumption was that 
the bank who sent us the VB registration form also included a check for the VB fee, but that wasn’t the case so the VB 
fee slipped through the cracks and went to assessment. We then attempted to deal with it back in January, and maybe I 
dropped the ball and forgot about it, but we need to get this VB fee assessment deleted asap please. Let me know. 
Thanks! 
 

 

Matt Dornfeld 
DSI - Case Manager 
375 Jackson St 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-1902 
F: 651-266-1919 
matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

  

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America  

DSI’s Mission: To preserve and improve the quality of life in Saint Paul   
by protecting and promoting public health and safety for all. 
 


