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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, January 27, 2020 2:02 PM
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1981 3rd St E Acct 3-0923-8610658

It should be exonerated. The property owner filled out a vacancy request on 05/31/2019. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 11:59 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Young, Susan (CI-StPaul) <Susan.Young@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 1981 3rd St E Acct 3-0923-8610658 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Clare, 
 
Please review and respond to Manteza’s email below. 
 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>  
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 9:48 AM 
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To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: FW: 1981 3rd St E Acct 3-0923-8610658 
 
Clare, 
 
Please review and respond to Manteza’s email below. 
 
Thank you, 
 
 
 
 
Romack Franklin  
Municipal Services Manager  
Greater St. Paul Area 
 
4325 E. 66th Street 
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076 
e  rfranklin3@republicservices.com 
o  651-286-4575  c  612-300-7497 
w  www.republicservices.com  
 

 
 

From: Nawodi, Manteza <MNawodi@republicservices.com>  
Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2020 9:46 AM 
To: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com> 
Subject: 1981 3rd St E Acct 3-0923-8610658 
 
Hello Romack Franklin 
 
Please can you verify with City If this property was exonerated for Q3 2019 by Chris, the resident property was vacant 
 
Thank you 
 
Manteza Nawodi 
Billing Coordinator 
 
4325 66th St E 
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076 
e  mnawodi@republicservices.com 
o  651-286-4569 
w  RepublicServices.com 
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