Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 1:00 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul); Young, Susan (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry
Attachments: RE: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see attached email and information below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 12:45 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: FW: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

See the attached e-mail - $4.85 is what Pete’s gave us

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 11:43 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Mary,
Please see request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, January 14, 2020 10:53 AM




To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; grevering.sph@gmail.com
Subject: RE: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Any update on this? | only ask because Mary is generally pretty quick to respond. Greg, feel free to e-mail me Mary’s
response directly. This e-mail does not need to be forwarded to her.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

D %

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, January 13, 2020 10:08 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Thanks Mary! He had a small 35 gallon cart so shouldn’t the late fee have been $3.52? 5% of $70.34 is $3.52. Why the
$4.85 charge?

Chris

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 4:55 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see Mary’s update below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054



From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 4:50 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Okay — Pete’s had billed him $70.34 on 7.5.19 — he paid $66.09 (7.25.19 posted to account)- leaving a balance of $4.25.
He incurred one finance charge of $4.85 from Pete’s because he hadn’t paid prior to Pete’s sending over their balances
to us.

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 4:16 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Mary,
Please see information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 4:14 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Hi WM,
Please see (Q3) Assessment Inquiry.
Thanks,

Chris

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 4:13 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 766 Syndicate Street South - (Q3) Assessment Inquiry

Please forward to Waste Management

Property Address & PID: 766 Syndicate Street South (PID: 152823140041)
3



Property Owner: Joseph C. Jansen

Phone Number or Email: 651699371; joe@bigjoesgarage.com
Pending Assessment Amount: $9.10

Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Q3

Summary of Issue: Could you break down this Q3 bill by item? Property owner stated that Pete’s Rubbish missed his
last pick up of on 07/02/2019. He stated that he called about the missed pick up a few days later and Pete’s did not
provide him with a reimbursement. He therefore calculated that the missed pick up was worth around $4.25 and did not
pay that amount of his Q3 bill (he only paid a total of $66.09). However, the assessment that was sent to us doesn’t
seem to match up with a $4.25 plus three additional late payments of $3.04, which would add up to a total of $13.37.
Please respond as to how the $9.10 was calculated.

Thank you!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

DY

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



