Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2019 4:36 PM

To: Kirby, Joseph (CI-StPaul); Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Rebar, Jeannette (Cl-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 695 Hazel St N - CG1903E3

Hi Joe and Alisha,
Can you please get this entered for the Oct 31 hearing?
Could you draft something to RS inquiring about if they had something set up.

Thanks!
Chris

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, October 17, 2019 9:04 AM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Kirby, Joseph (CI-StPaul)
<Joseph.Kirby@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul) <Alisha.Black@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Rebar, Jeannette (CI-StPaul)
<Jeannette.Rebar@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 695 Hazel St N - CG1903E3

Joan Buss called and wants to dispute the late fees. Her hearing is on Oct 31 at 10 a.m.
Please enter a file for that date and time. NOTE: she also has a Q3 late fee as well.

Reason: she likes to pay her garbage monthly rather than quarterly. She said she sends in monthly fees and she had
called her hauler and she was told they would remove the late fees.

Mai X. Vang

Legislative Hearing Coordinator
Saint Paul City Council

15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8563

F: 651-266-8574
mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us

it Lrwatbse

Ty in Aamierca

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America



