From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Black, Alisha (CI-StPaul); Kirby, Joseph (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: FW: Q2 and Q3 Assessment for 736 Sims
Date: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 3:53:38 PM

Tell Mary that she is amazing and that this made me chuckle in my otherwise crazy off the wall day!

Chris

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 3:48 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: FW: Q2 and Q3 Assessment for 736 Sims

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see Mary’s update below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 3:42 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Subject: RE: FW: Q2 and Q3 Assessment for 736 Sims

You would think they should have figured out by now that they don’t pay us off the old WM account
- they called us the first two times it happened but not until now for 2" and 3™ Quarters — go ahead

and reverse the amounts sent over for 2" and 3™ quarters and | will fix on our end.

Thanks
Mary P

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 2:48 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: Q2 and Q3 Assessment for 736 Sims
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Mary,
Please see request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, October 22, 2019 2:45 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: Q2 and Q3 Assessment for 736 Sims

Hi Mary,

Surya Vang

736 Sims Ave

612-205-8812

Resident called me about the Q2 assessment for 736 Sims- WM sent over $193.03, He said that he
contacted WM and they were able to find his payment and apply it on the outstanding amount.

Should we remove this Q2 assessment?

He also said this happened in Q3 and | see that there is an assessment sent to the city. Can you look
into this?

Chris

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.
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