From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul
Subject: RE: 82 Prospect Blvd with 2 Accts 8614245 and 8605964
Date: Thursday, September 19, 2019 12:06:03 PM

We will get this done.
Cs

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2019 11:15 AM

To: Chao, Diana (ClI-StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: 82 Prospect Blvd with 2 Accts 8614245 and 8605964

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see update from Manteza.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Nawodi, Manteza <MNawodi@republicservices.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2019 11:14 AM

To: Franklin, Romack <REranklin3@republicservices.com>; grevering.sph@gmail.com
Subject: 82 Prospect Blvd with 2 Accts 8614245 and 8605964

Please can you removed this assessment #190123 for $107.07, this property had 2 accts this
8614245 was opened by error, we closed it on 04/24/19 everything credit except pulling the
assessment from the city

Thank you

Manteza Nawodi
Billing Coordinator

4325 66th St E

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e mnawodi@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4569

w RepublicServices.com
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We'll handle it from herel



