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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Friday, August 2, 2019 9:46 AM
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal

Thank you! I called and left VMs for both customers to inform them of the cart swaps and remind them to pay their Q3 
bill. 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 2:54 PM 
To: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 1:53 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 
Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 
Chris, 
Please see update from Lee below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Lenora Johnson <lenora.johnson@advanceddisposal.com>  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 1:40 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 

 1280 7th St W- ADS will swap out carts next Tuesday August 6th, 2016. I will make the name change today. Please 
remind customer that the current bill is not paid and does need to be paid in full 

 
 649 Simon Ave-ADS will swap out carts this Friday August 2nd, 2019. Please let this customer know that the next 

pick up for EOW will be August 9th, 2019. Please remind customer that the current bill is not paid and does need 
to be paid in full 

  
 

Thank you have a great day 
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From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 12:58 PM 
To: Lenora Johnson <lenora.johnson@advanceddisposal.com> 
Subject: FW: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 
Lee, 
Please see request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 12:57 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 
Hi Greg, 
 
Please pass this this onto ADS for a response? 
 
Chris  
 

From: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)  
Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 12:03 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: LH Follow-Up from 8/1/19 - Advanced Disposal 
 
Hello Greg, 
 
Here are a few items we need to follow up with Advanced Disposal from the legislative hearing today. 
 

 1280 7th St W 
o Please remove 3 64-g and 1 96-g. Deliver 4 35-g weekly. 
o Please update billing information (name only) to Reimagine Real Estate 540 Lake St Excelsior MN 55331. 

 649 Simon Ave 
o Please remove 1 64-g and deliver 1 35-g EOW. 

 
Thank you! 
 

Diana Chao 
Solid Waste Programs Specialist
Saint Paul Public Works 
25 West 4th Street 
1500 City Hall Annex 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-6216 
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diana.chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

 
 
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 

 


