Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul)
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 4:54 PM
To: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 2141 STANFORD AVE

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 4:28 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 2141 STANFORD AVE

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see Romack’s update below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 4:23 PM

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 2141 STANFORD AVE

Chris,

Please pull the following assessment from Jan 2019 thru March 2019 and April 2019 thru June 2019. The home was sold
on 4/2019 and we were sent a check from Title Smart dated 4/26/19. It was unapplied and we did not know about it
until today.

Thank you,

Romack Franklin
Municipal Services Manager
Greater St. Paul Area

4325 E. 66" Street
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076
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We'll handle it from here.”



