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Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

From: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 11:50 AM
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 864 Dayton Ave- billing issue

Added to delinquent corrections list and Q1 LH spreadsheet. 
 
Also called PO and left VM to inform assessment will be removed during LH. 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul)  
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2019 11:36 AM 
To: Chao, Diana (CI‐StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 4:34 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
 
Please see Frances’ response below. 
 
 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
 

From: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 4:34 PM 
To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: FW: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 
Chris, 
 
Please see Frances’ response below. 
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Romack Franklin  
Municipal Services Manager  
Greater St. Paul Area 
 
4325 E. 66th Street 
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076 
e  rfranklin3@republicservices.com 
o  651‐286‐4575  c  612‐300‐7497 
w  www.republicservices.com  
 

 
 

From: Estrella, Frances  
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 2:19 PM 
To: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com> 
Subject: RE: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 
Remove assessment  
 

Frances Estrella  
Billing Coordinator 
 
4325 66th St E 
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076 
e  festrella@republicservices.com 
o  651‐286‐4588 
w  RepublicServices.com 
 

 
 
 

From: Franklin, Romack  
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 10:08 AM 
To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com> 
Subject: FW: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 
Please read below and let me know if the assessment should be removed? 
 
Thank you  
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Romack Franklin  
Municipal Services Manager  
Greater St. Paul Area 
 
4325 E. 66th Street 
Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076 
e  rfranklin3@republicservices.com 
o  651‐286‐4575  c  612‐300‐7497 
w  www.republicservices.com  
 

 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 9:47 AM 
To: Franklin, Romack <RFranklin3@republicservices.com> 
Subject: FW: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 

Note that (grevering.sph@gmail.com) is an external email. Report suspicious emails by clicking on “Report 
Phishing", or forward to "infosec.phishing@republicservices.com" 

Romack, 
Please see Chris’s request below. 
 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 23, 2019 9:47 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: 864 Dayton Ave‐ billing issue 
 
Hi Republic, 
 
Diane Bradley Lewis  
864 Dayton Ave (fathers old house)  
612‐229‐8388 
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Resident called in about a Q1 2019 assessment for $218.87.  She stated that she paid this amount on 3/20/2109.  Went 
through on March 21st.   She has a confirmation number of 304446570052.  Did she make payment on this account?  She 
thinks that there were two accounts at the property as she took over for her father after his passing. 
 
Can we remove this assessment?  Thanks  
 
Chris 
 


