Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, April 15,2019 9:18 AM

To: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 950 Ashland Ave - Q4 2018 RS Assessment Question

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

From: Franklin, Romack [mailto:RFranklin3@republicservices.com]

Sent: Monday, April 15,2019 7:57 AM

To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fwd: 950 Ashland Ave - Q4 2018 RS Assessment Question

Please see below

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Estrella, Frances" <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Date: April 13,2019 at 8:03:35 AM CDT

To: "Franklin, Romack" <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Subject: RE: 950 Ashland Ave - Q4 2018 RS Assessment Question

No credits it was certified

Frances Estrella
Insides Sales Rep

4325 66th Street East

Inver Grove Heights, MN 55076

e festrella@republicservices.com

c 612-516-1018

f 651-286-4547 w www.republicservices.com
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We'll handle it from here”



From: Franklin, Romack

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 4:20 PM

To: Estrella, Frances

Subject: Fwd: 950 Ashland Ave - Q4 2018 RS Assessment Question

Can you please tell me if there were any credits applied during Q4 2018 and what the amount
was?

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)"
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Date: April 12,2019 at 3:53:45 PM CDT

To: "Franklin, Romack" <RFranklin3@republicservices.com>
Subject: RE: 950 Ashland Ave - Q4 2018 RS Assessment Question

Please let us know if there were any credits applied during Q4 2018 and what the
amount was.



