Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

From: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 10:33 AM
To: 'Zach Luckett’

Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 677 Thomas

To confirm: payment received was for work on 677 Thomas. Both checks, including the post-dated check, were
deposited. You’re waiting for your bank to let you know if there are sufficient funds currently to cover the check.

From: Zach Luckett [mailto:zachmog@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 10:20 AM

To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: Re: 677 Thomas

Yes, it is. And the check went through, but I'm waiting on a response from my bank also.

On Wed, Oct 24, 2018, 9:47 AM Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Good Morning Zach,

There is no reference on the checks as to which property they are to be applied. The subject line of your email is 677
Thomas. Is it this property? Also, | noticed the check from Hooyo Huno Housing is post-dated to October 31.

Thank you, Marcia

From: Zach Luckett [mailto:zachmog@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 24, 2018 8:13 AM

To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond®@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pooh The Gospel Singer
<zachmog@gmail.com>

Subject: 677 Thomas

This payment was issued to McLemore as of Saturday October 21st, for |, Zach was very busy on Friday the assigned
date. Please feel free to contact me with any questions.



