Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, September 28, 2018 3:10 PM

To: Vang, Mai (Cl-StPaul)

Cc: Dornfeld, Matt (Cl-StPaul); Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul); Townsend, Tanya (Cl-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 1929 Randolph Avenue, VB Fee

Mai, we can process a resolution reducing this to $500. -Marcia

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, September 27,2018 11:29 AM

To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul)
<joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Townsend, Tanya (ClI-StPaul) <tanya.townsend@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: 1929 Randolph Avenue, VB Fee

Importance: High

Marcia,
| got a call from Mr. Alam reminding me of our phone conversation (see below). This didn’t happen and it didn’t get on
the Agenda for review. He got the invoice to pay now.

Can you look at this and see if it should be prorated?

Owner was in the VB from April to August. It’s a Cat 1. House has been occupied since August 1. Vb filed closed on
August 23. Thanks.

Mai Vang

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, September 14, 2018 12:20 PM

To: 'ahmadalam@yahoo.com' <ahmadalam@yahoo.com>

Cc: Dornfeld, Matt (CI-StPaul) <matt.dornfeld@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Yannarelly, Joe (ClI-StPaul)
(joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us) <joe.yannarelly@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 1929 Randolph Avenue, VB Fee

Hello Mr. Alam,

Per our phone conversation, | will add this property to the September 18 Legislative Hearing Agenda for review. You
went into the VB Program in April; therefore, you were in the program for 4 months. | will present this information to
the hearing officer and see what she recommends and will email you with result.



Mai X. Vang

Legislative Hearing Coordinator
Saint Paul City Council

15 W Kellogg Bvd, Ste. 310
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8563

F: 651-266-8574
mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us
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