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From: Smith, Bret (CI-StPaul)

To: Moermond, Marcia (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: RE: Property Tax Assessment - Formerly Towed Vehicle
Date: Monday, May 16, 2016 3:47:30 PM

Attachments: call#156804olds.pdf

image001.png

Marcia,

Attached is a breakdown of the Police cost that were sent to DSI.

This car came to our lot in June 2015. Typically, it would then be sold in 1 % to 3 months on
average, depending on various factors. For some reason this car was not sold for like 7 months
later, which is why the Police cost is so high, as we get 15 per day of storage. Looking at computer
records it looks like it should have been put in our 7/30/2015 auction. | assume it was somehow left
out and discovered that it was still here during our yearend inventory, then put up for auction on
1/21/2015.

If it would help, maybe you can put the Police Cost back to what they would have been had it been
sold on 7/30/2015. That would be 54 days of storage @ 15.00 per day or 810.00.

Then the total Police cost would be:
60.00 tow charge

80.00 impound admin. Cost

810.00 storage fees

$950.00 Total Police cost.
Sorry, if | find out anything meaningful more on it I'll let you know.
Please let me know if this is helpful.

Sincerely, Bret

From: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2016 11:54 AM

To: Smith, Bret (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: Property Tax Assessment - Formerly Towed Vehicle

Hi Bret,

Here is a link to the file on 287 Sidney St. E. which is in front of me tomorrow.
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City of Saint Paul Call # 156804 Invoice #156804C

Call Status: Completed Call Taken: 6/9/15 13:42 by import

Tow Customer: C - Code Enforcement Sale Customer: [TE]

Location: 287 E SIDNEY Destination: 830 Barge Channel Road,Saint Paul, MN

Tow Type: Light Duty ' Priority: 9 Appointment: Mileage Reqd].i::,]i\?(\_): -

Reason: cher Truck Reqd.: Discount %: 0.00
No Charge: No Portal To Portal: No 2nd Commission Applies: No Last Mod.: 5/16/16 14:57 by bsmith7
Control Customer: C - Code Enforcement Caller: Phone #:

Dispatch Notes: HEALTH TOW WO#7743 )

Yr/Make/Model: 1998 Oldsmobile Intrigue Color/Body: Black Four Door License: MN 538HJE
VIN: IG3WS52K9WF334226 Odometer: Tag Expiry: Other Info: 1998 OLDSMOBILE

: INTRIGUE BLACK

Owner: GUENTHNER, DENIS Phone #: Owner With Vehicle: No Hold: No Hold Until:
Zone: 0 Police #: Police Beat:

Case #: 15118432

Call Source: Seller: System Data:

Driver: Proxy Driver [999] Truck #: 999 Status: Completed

Assigned: 6/9/15 13:42 by import Dispatched: 6/9/15 13:42 by import - Acknowledged: 6/9/15 13:42 by import
Arrived: 6/9/15 13:42 by import Hooked: 6/9/15 13:42 by import Dropped: 6/9/15 13:42 by import
Completed: 6/9/15 13:42 by import Total Mileage: Commissionable Amount ($): 0.00
Lot: Impound Lot Date In: 6/9/2015 1:42:00PM Date Out: 1/21/2016 2:29:56PM by sadams2
Lot Location: 06 Stop Billing Date: Planned Auction Date: 1/21/2016
Final Disposition: Auctioned Key Loc.: UNKNOWN 12:00:00AM

Released To: * Metro Metals, 2576 Doswell
Ave, St Paul, MN 55108

Initial Secondary Tertiary Total
Re Driver #Truck # Min. Max. Qty. -CLICM Oty Rate ($) Units Flat Oty Rate ($) Units FlafRate (§)Unit DTC Price ($)
N 999 999 1.00 N Y 60.00 N N NYN  60.00
Description: Light Duty Towing Fee Last Modification: 6/9/15 13:42 by import
N 999 999 1.00 N Y 80.00 N N NYN  80.00
Description: Admin Fee Last Modification: 6/9/15 13:42 by import
N 22700 Y N 1.00  0.00 D N 15.00 D N NNN 3,390.00
Description: Storage Charge _ Last Modification: 1/21/16 14:29 by sadams2
Sub Total ($): 3,530.00
Discount Sub Total ($): 0.00 @ 0.00% = 0.00
Taxable Sub Total ($): 140.00 @ 7.63% = 10.68

Total ($):  3,540.68

Rept. Type Pymt. Type Check/Credit Card # Authorization # Xird Amount ($)
Sale Payment  Check No 100.00
Received: 1/21/16 14:29 by Shannon Adams Reconciled: 2/2/16 12:45 by sadams2 Created By: sadams2
Payments Total ($): 100.00
Lien Process Name:Lien Process Status: Lien Acquired Opened: 6/9/2015 1:42:00PM
Notes: Lien Price: Closed: 1/11/2016 9:48:06PM
Cert. Letter Dt 6/11/2015 Cert., Letter Dt
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Commander JoshuaLego
Records, Property and Evidence
Support Services Division

Saint Paul Police Department

367 Grove Street

Saint Paul, MN 55101

P: 651-266-5700

C: 6512167533

F- 6512665711

Joshua Lego@ci.stpaul.mn.us/







Please let me know all you can on the make-up of expenses on this. SPPD ended up with some
$3,400 in expenses.

Thank you, Marcia

From: Smith, Bret (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2016 2:19 PM

To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: Property Tax Assessment - Formerly Towed Vehicle

Marcia,

Please send me the information, or call me and I'll try to answer your question 651-292-6005

From: Lego, Joshua (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2016 2:15 PM

To: Smith, Bret (CI-StPaul); Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Subject: Property Tax Assessment - Formerly Towed Vehicle

Bret,

May | ask you to contact Marsha at 685707 She has a question regarding how we came to a fee
amount on a forfeited vehicle which is now being passed along as a property tax assessment to the
RO at their home address in St. Paul.

Commander Joshual.ego
Records, Property and Evidence
Support Services Division

Saint Paul Police Department

367 Grove Street

Saint Paul, MN 55101
P:651-266-5700

C:651-216-7533

F:651-266-3711

Joshua. Leso/@cl stpaul mn.us/






