ISA Certified Arborist MN-4365A.
Certified Tree Inspector #20104237
MDA Pesticide Applicator License #20128599
Twin City Tree Contact Information
Address: 981 LYDIA DRIVE W. ROSEVILLE, MN. 55113

Web Site: tctreecareinc.com

E-mail:  twincitytree@gmail.com
Bus. Phone 651-645-2933

Estimate

Date

8/26/2015

Customer Information

Rachel Toberman
1198 Sherburne Ave
St Paul, MN

55104

Home Phone: 612-695-9040

Alternate Phone:

Email: |ritobermant@email.com
18

Qty Description of Service Total
1 | Boxelder in Backyard - Remove off of fence . 57>4,000.00T
1 |Haul away debris in Rachel's yard AS{GD 500.00T
G285 OO
R—
No Stump Chip Removal Unless Indicated. Subtotal Stsna00
Includes Full Cleanup of Brush, Logs and Debris
unless otherwise indicated. Sales Tax (7.125%) $320.63
Certified Arborist: Dean J Turner MN43654 Total $4.820.63

Customers Signature:




Cash, Tom

e — S—————— ——— S m———— s ]
From: Cash, Tom

Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 3:18 PM

To: '‘Rachel Lauren'

Cc: "twincitytree@gmail.com’

Subject: RE: Estimate 201726 from Twin City Tree Service

Attachments: Scan0069.pdf

Rachel,

| spoke with Dean today and told him Country was accepting his estimate and would make payment for what your
coverage allowed.

| accepted the $4,000.00 removal charge plus $285.00 tax for a total of $4,285.00:

I accepted the $500.00 charge for debris removal. | could not pay the tax on this fee because the coverage caps out at
$500.00.

The total Country owes is $4,785.00.

| have to apply your $1,000.00 deductible, so the check | am putting in today’s mail is payable to just you and is in the
amount of $3,785.00. See attached.

| gave Dean the go ahead to schedule the removal.

Any questions, please let me know.

Thanks.

Tom Cash

Sr. Claims Representative
Country Financial
612-750-3038 Cell & Office
651-631-4657 Fax

THIS EMAIL AND ANY FILES TRANSMITTED WITH IT ARE CONFIDENTIAL AND ARE INTENDED SOLELY FOR THE USE OF THE INDIVIDUAL OR ENTITY TO WHOM THEY ARE
ADDRESSED. If you are not the intended recipient or the person responsible for delivering the email to the intended recipient, be advised that you have received this
email in error and that any use, dissemination, forwarding, printing, or copying of this email is strictly prohibited. Any inadvertent receipt by you of confidential
information shall not constitute a waiver of confidentiality. The sender disclaims liability for error or omissions in the content of this message that arise as a result of
email transmission. If you have received this email in error, please return immediately to the sender and delete this copy from your system. Thank you for your
cooperation.

From: Rachel Lauren [mailto:ritoberman@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, August 27, 2015 1:17 PM

To: Cash, Tom

Subject: Fwd: Estimate 201726 from Twin City Tree Service
Dear Rachel :

Please review the attached estimate, if you have any questions please feel free to contact us.
We look forward to assisting you with your project.
Sincerely,

Dean & Dawn

Twin City Tree Service
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