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We all agree that e-cigarettes are significantly less harmful than smoking. One in 2 
lifelong smokers dies from their addiction. All of the evidence suggests that the health 
risks posed by e-cigarettes are relatively small by comparison but we must continue to 
study the long term effects. 

And yet, millions of smokers have the impression that e-cigarettes are at least as 
harmful as tobacco and we have a responsibility to provide clear information on the 
facts as we know them to be. It is our duty to provide reassurance for the 1.1 million e-
cigarette users who have completely stopped smoking to prevent their relapse. 

To be clear, the public health opportunity is in helping smokers to quit, so we may 
encourage smokers to try vaping but we certainly encourage vapers to stop smoking 
tobacco completely. 

We know that e-cigarettes are the most popular quitting tool in the country with more 
than 10 times as many people using them than using local stop smoking services. But, 
we also know that using local stop smoking services is by far the most effective way to 
quit. 

What we need to do is combine the most popular method with the most effective and 
that is why we are encouraging those who want to use e-cigarettes to quit smoking to 
seek the help of their local stop smoking service. 

The current national evidence is that in the UK regular e-cigarette use is almost 
exclusively confined to those young people who smoke, and youth smoking prevalence 
is continuing to fall. This is an area that we will continue to research and keep under 
closest surveillance. In October this year, regulations to protect children will make it an 
offence to sell e-cigarettes to anyone under 18 or to buy e-cigarettes for them and within 
a year the EU Tobacco Products Directive proposes a ban on all print and broadcast 
advertising of e-cigarettes as part of a full range of regulations. 
The concerns on Public Health England’s evidence review, raised by McKee and 
Capewell in the BMJ today, are not new and have been covered andfully responded to 
before. 

https://www.gov.uk/government/organisations/public-health-england
https://www.gov.uk/government/policies/smoking
http://www.smokinginengland.info/downloadfile/?type=latest-stats&src=11
http://www.smokinginengland.info/downloadfile/?type=latest-stats&src=11
https://www.gov.uk/government/consultations/draft-regulations-on-the-sale-and-manufacture-of-tobacco-products
https://www.gov.uk/government/publications/e-cigarettes-an-evidence-update
http://www.thelancet.com/journals/lancet/article/PIIS0140-6736(15)00042-2/abstract
http://www.thelancet.com/journals/lancet/article/PIIS0140-6736(15)00107-5/fulltext


We should not forget what is important here. We know that smoking is the number one 
killer in England and we have a public health responsibility to provide smokers with the 
information and the tools to help them quit smoking completely and forever. 

PHE has always been very clear on its commitment to providing up to date information 
on the emerging evidence on e-cigarettes, as shown in therecent review which is 
the third in this area in the last 2 years. This commitment drove PHE and Cancer 
Research UK to set up the UK E-cigarette Research Forum. PHE is honouring its 
longstanding promise to monitor and share the evidence, providing clear messages to 
the public. 

There is no circumstance in which it is better for a smoker to continue smoking – a habit 
that kills 1 in every 2 and harms many others, costing the NHS and society billions 
every year. We will continue to share what we know and address what we don’t yet 
know, to ensure clear, consistent messages for the public and health professionals. 
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