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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, June 08, 2015 1:27 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 1324-1330 Grand assessment

The File No. CRT1412, Asmt No. 148213, Ratified 10/1/2014, Amt Certified is $542.34.  

Thanks 

 

Tanya Townsend 
Office of Financial Services 
Real Estate Assessments 

25 W 4th St, 1000 City Hall Annex 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8858 
F: 651-266-8855 

View Assessments at: www.stpaul.gov/assessments

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 

 

From: Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)  

Sent: Monday, June 08, 2015 1:24 PM 

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) 
Cc: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul); Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul) 

Subject: 1324-1330 Grand assessment 

 

Hi Mai, 

 

Looks like this guy paid and it went to assessments. Please do a resolution to delete the assessment. Tanya will do her 

end after you are done. Thanks! 

 

 

 

Leanna Shaff, CBO, CFI 

Fire Safety Inspector III 
Department of Safety and Inspections
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8980 

F: 651-266-8951 

leanna.shaff@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 

 


