Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, June 03, 2015 10:17 AM

To: ‘Mark Mancini'

Subject: RE: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Mr. Mancini,
Looks like after looking at the fuel burning testing, she reduced from 5555 to $300. If you wish to contest
further, you may attend tonight’s public hearing at 5:30 p.m. in Room 300 Council Chambers.

Mai Vang

Coordinator for Legislative Hearings
City Council Offices

15 W. Kellogg Blvd, Ste. 310

Saint Paul, MN 55102

Direct: 651-266-8563

Appeals Line: 651-266-8585

Fax: 651-266-8574

Tha Pias Ll mai.vang @ci.stpaul.mn.us

= Y

From: Mark Mancini [mailto:mark.mancini@oracle.com]

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 11:51 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

| think Marcia was mostly looking to validate that I actually sent the email (and report) to Brian on Sept 23™. His office
has a clean copy.

Let me know if Marcia needs to read the report. If yes, | will scan it again and send it.

Thanks

Mark Mancini |
Cell: 612.845.1613 | Fax: 952.953.6431

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) [mailto:mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us]

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 11:47 AM

To: Mark Mancini

Subject: RE: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Is there a way to make it darker. It’s hard to read .

From: Mark Mancini [mailto:mark.mancini@oracle.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 11:45 AM




To: Mark Mancini; Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Mai,

| think the file was too large. | scanned to docs and have attached them to this email.
Please see my explanation in my initial email yesterday to Marcia that didn’t get through.
Thank you,

Mark

Mark Mancini |
Cell: 612.845.1613 | Fax: 952.953.6431

From: Mark Mancini

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 11:35 AM

To: mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us

Subject: FW: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Mai,

Thanks for your help. Please let me know if you or Marcia have questions.
Regards,

Mark

Mark Mancini |
Cell: 612.845.1613 | Fax: 952.953.6431

From: Mark Mancini

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 11:29 AM

To: legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us

Subject: FW: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Sorry for the delay. The email kicked back from yesterday...

Mark Mancini |
Cell: 612.845.1613 | Fax: 952.953.6431

From: Mark Mancini

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 10:48 AM

To: legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us

Cc: Mark Mancini

Subject: FW: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Marcia,
Thank you for your time and patience this morning.
Per your request, | am forwarding the email | sent to Brian Schmidt on September 23, 2014 with the fuel burning

equipment safety test report attached. The test report was logged by Brian late November, but you can see from the
email date that he had it on Sept 23™.



With this evidence, | believe you said you would recommend removing all of the Administrative Fees (5155) and one of
the Inspection charges (5100). That will leave a balance due of $300.

If this is correct, would you please tell me if | send payment to the Department of Safety or pay it in my next property tax
payment.

Thank you again for your help.
Best regards,
Mark

Mark Mancini | Cell: 612.845.1613 | Fax: 952.953.6431

From: Mark Mancini

Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2014 10:05 AM

To: brian.schmidt@ci.stpaul.mn.us

Cc: Mark Mancini

Subject: Fuel Burning Safety Test Report for 1134 Jessie St Units A & B

Brian,

Please find the subject report attached.
Thank you,

Mark

Mark Mancini
Mobile: 1 612 845 1613




