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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Sandberg, Connie (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2015 8:02 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 452 Concord St

Thank you, Mai! 

 

Connie Sandberg 
Management Assistant III 
DSI - Code Enforcement 
375 Jackson St, Suite 220 

Saint Paul, MN 55101-1806 

P: 651-266-1935  
F: 651-266-1919 

connie.sandberg@ci.stpaul.mn.us

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 

 

 

 
 

 

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)  

Sent: Wednesday, March 25, 2015 7:58 AM 

To: Sandberg, Connie (CI-StPaul); Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul) 
Cc: Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul) 

Subject: RE: 452 Concord St 

 

I will prepare the resolution 

 

From: Sandberg, Connie (CI-StPaul)  

Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2015 8:20 AM 

To: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul) 
Cc: Yannarelly, Joe (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) 

Subject: RE: 452 Concord St 

 

Tanya, 

(and Joe and Mai) 

 

Apparently I dropped the ball on this one.  I found this message in the fee folder, regarding the 10/31/14 assessment: 

11/5/14:  LHO ordered fee assessment be deleted and 90 day waiver entered. Submitted an Authorization to Adjust. 

Waiver can be entered when there's a fee to be waived. Cs 

 

This means that the 10/31/14 assessment (VB1504) Tanya referred to should have been deleted, back on 11/5/14.  My 

apologies! 

 

Mai – or Joe – Would one of you be able to prepare the Resolution to delete the assessment?  The file was closed on 

11/6/14. 

 

Thank you, 
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Connie Sandberg 
Management Assistant III 
DSI - Code Enforcement 
375 Jackson St, Suite 220 

Saint Paul, MN 55101-1806 

P: 651-266-1935  
F: 651-266-1919 

connie.sandberg@ci.stpaul.mn.us

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 

 

 

 
 

 

From: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul)  

Sent: Thursday, March 19, 2015 1:51 PM 

To: Sandberg, Connie (CI-StPaul); Senty, Dennis (CI-StPaul) 
Cc: Magner, Steve (CI-StPaul) 

Subject: 452 Concord St 

 

The owner contacted the Assessment Office and said he already paid his Vacant Bldg Fee.  

I just need someone to double check that the VBR is pain in full as he stated. If this is correct someone will need to do a 

Resolution to remove File No VB1504 which was sent to my Office in October 2014. Thanks 

 

Tanya Townsend 
Office of Financial Services 
Real Estate Assessments 

25 W 4th St, 1000 City Hall Annex 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651-266-8858 
F: 651-266-8855 

View Assessments at: www.stpaul.gov/assessments

 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America 
 

 


