Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Ross, John Peter (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Monday, February 23, 2015 9:51 AM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 648 Robert St S

Mai,

Please delete assessment for 648 Robert St S. $155.00 total.
Project J1502E, Assessment 158301. AMANDA file 14-292886, Invoice 1115763.

This particular EC was for expired tabs on a vehicle. The EC that was previously cancelled was for a washer in his
driveway, that parks found to be done by owner. The owner did not return a gold card on the vehicle issue, but he did
eventually put the tabs on vehicle. In looking at the file, this was the time when there was the AMANDA “change over”
and the Vehicle Abatement order that was saved in AMANDA is blank. So if he wants to appeal, we are lacking proper
documentation.

So yes, please cancel this particular assessment. If you have any questions., please call me at 266-1914.

~John

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, February 20, 2015 11:29 AM
To: Ross, John Peter (CI-StPaul)
Subject: 648 Robert St S

John,
William Uhlenkott called our office that he got an invoice for EC of $155. It went to Council on Jan 7 for
adoption.

From looking at notes in STAMP, I came across your note that you canceled the PA EC. Should the EC be
assessed?

Mai



