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RESOLUTION

CITY OF SAINT PAUL, MINNESOTA

Presented by

WHEREAS, the Police Department was awarded a grant in the amount of $10,000 from Target

Corporation; and

WHEREAS, the grant funds will fund the upgrade to the Homicide Unit interview room including the

upgrade to cameras and equipment; and

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that council accepts this grant agreement and Chief Thomas Smith

to implement the grant agreement.

Yeas

Nays

Absent

Bostrom

Brendmoen

Lantry

Stark

Thao

Thune

Tolbert

Adopted by Council:  Date

Adoption Certified by Council Secretary
By:

Approved by Mayor: Date

By:

Requr&e%)/ ?aWLICE

By: Thomas E. Smith, Chief of Police
Approved by the Office of Financial Services
By:

Approved by City Attorney
By:

Approved by Mayor for Submission to Council
By:




TARGET CORPORATION
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ENDOR NAME: SAINT PAUL POLICE DEPT VENDOR NO: 18612
VENDOR DOC# SAP DOC# | DOC DATE GROSS DEDUCTIONS | NET AMOUNT
gggggﬁfggﬁfggg NTERREWRGS S 1931953780 | 10/27/2014 10,000.00 0.00 10,000.00
GROSS AMOUNT DEDUCTIONS NET AMOUNT CHECK DATE CHECK #
10,000.00 0.00 10,000.00 11/06/2014 2139009
PLEASE PROVIDE CHECK #, VENDOR #, AND SAP DOCUMENT #
WHEN WRITING OR CALL TARGET (612) 307-9208 * Withholding Tax Amount
¥ REMOVE DOCUMENT ALONG THIS PERFORATION v

Target Corporation , Wells.Fargo Bank NA : DATE 56-382 [

. CHECK NO. |
PO Box 1296 Van Wert, OH
Minneapolis, MN 55440-1296 ks 11/106/2014 e 2139009
9600138673
NET AMOUNT
PAY TEN THOUSAND AND 00/100------ *§10,000.00

IQSEE  SAINT PAUL POLICE DEPT

THIS CHECK IS VOID IF NOT CASHED WITHIN 150 DAYS.
pish 367 GROVE STREET s
SAINT PAUL, MN 55101-2416 T
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Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Andersen, Jim (CI-StPaul)" <jim.andersen@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Date: November 7, 2014 at 5:30:05 PM CST

To: "Martinez, Bill (CI-StPaul)" <bill.martinez@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Ce: "Gray, Shari (CI-StPaul)" <shari.gray@ci.stpaul.mn.us>, "Donahue, Bobby (CI-StPaul)"
<bobby.donahue@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: Your Target grant request

A/C Martinez,
I wanted to pass the good news.
Jim

From: application.notification@target.com [application.notification@target.com]
Sent: Friday, November 07, 2014 3:02 PM

To: Andersen, Jim (CI-StPaul)

Subject: Your Target grant request

Mr. Jim Andersen

Sergeant

Saint Paul Police Department
367 Grove Street

Saint Paul, MN 55101-2416

Program: Homicide Interview Room Upgrade
Amount: $10,000.00

Dear Mr. Andersen:

Target is pleased to inform your organization that a grant has been approved specifically for the
program and amount referenced above. Your grant check should arrive in the next few
days. Please note that your grant check is void if it is not cashed within five months.

If you choose to produce any announcements or articles in recognition of this grant, we ask that
you identify us as "Target". Resources to help you promote your partnership with Target are
available at target.com/marketingresources.

As always, Target grants are one-time gifts. By making annual commitments, we ensure we can
remain flexible and respond to changing community and business needs.

Since 1946, Target has given 5 percent of its profit - which today equals more than $4 million a
week - to local communities. Our more than 1,700 Target stores carry on this tradition by
making local grants and providing volunteer hours. We are proud to partner with organizations
like yours to meet the needs of our communities. Whether it's inspiring young minds, offering
unique cultural experiences or meeting your community's most basic needs; we thank you for
your continued commitment to making a difference
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You will receive a second email directing you to your account and requesting you fill out and
submit a "Charitable Contribution Receipt" as required by Internal Revenue Services

guidelines. After you receive your grant check, please follow the directions from that email, and
submit your "Charitable Contribution Receipt" electronically. If you have any questions, please
email Community.Relations@Target.com.

Sincerely,
Target Community Relations

The Mailbox which generated this email does not receive messages. It is a box for grant
notifications only.



Charitable Contribution Receipt - Grant Amount Page 1 of 2

Charitable Contribution Receipt - Grant Amount

Grant Information

In order for Target to comply with Internal Revenue Service guidelines, we ask that you acknowledge receipt of
any single charitable contribution of $250 or more.

Payee Organization Legal Name
Saint Paul Police Department

Payee Contact
Mr. Jim Andersen

Project Title
Homicide Interview Room Upgrade

Amount

10000

Payment Date

11/06/2014

Check Number
2139009

Please select the most appropriate statement.

Target did not receive or will not receive any goods or services in exchange for this contribution.
Please check the box if this statement is true

Yes

Target has received or will receive the following tangible goods or services in exchange for this contribution. (i.e. tickets -
total value = $149.50)
Choose the one that is most applicable

<None>

Please enter the total value of Goods or Services received.

If other, please explain.

https://www.grantrequest.com/SID_491/Default.asp?PRINTER=1&SESID=30454&AID... 11/18/2014
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For questions regarding this form, please e-mail Community.Relations@Target.com

https://www.grantrequest.com/SID_491/Default.asp?PRINTER=1& SESID=30454&AID... 11/18/2014



