Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Seeley, Paula (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, April 24, 2014 12:30 PM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 614 JESSAMINE

here it is

From: Seeley, Paula (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, April 15, 2014 1:39 PM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 614 JESSAMINE

| called GM and they were suspended on oct 11, 2013 till payment on Nov 12, 2013 and it looks like the were cut off
again 1/13 then unlocked 1/22. so James was right.

From: swain@garbagemanusa.com [mailto:swain@garbagemanusa.com]
Sent: Tuesday, April 15, 2014 1:25 PM

To: Seeley, Paula (CI-StPaul)

Subject: 614 JESSAMINE

Ms. Seeley,

Below are the dates supporting when the above address was locked for non-payment, & additionally once
payment was made, when the account was unlocked.

10/8/12-11/9/12 locked- payment made unlocked 12/4/12
10/11/13 locked- payment made unlocked 11/12/13
1/13/14 locked- payment made unlocked 1/22/14

Please let me know if you need additional information.

Shaunetta Swain

Call Center Manager
GarbageMan, A Green Company
763-404-4928 Direct
763-226-7506 Cell

swain @ garbagmanusa.com

**Go Green with us. Sign up for email billing**



