Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)

From: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 2:39 PM

To: Neis, Adrian (CI-StPaul); Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Muenich, Elizabeth (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: 950 Cromwell - Fee adjustmest

Here is the Info you will need on the RES.
File No CRT1403

Asmt No 148202

PH Hearing 1/15/2014

FYI File was entered in Our Real Estate system Sept 9, 2013.

Thanks,

Tanya Townsend

City of St. Paul - Assessments
1000 City Hall Annex

25 W. Fourth Street

Saint Paul, MN 55102
Tanya.Townsend @ci.stpaul.mn.us

Youl D)

View assessments at: www.stpaul.gov/assessments
Direct: 651.266.8858 Fax: 651.266.8855

From: Neis, Adrian (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2014 2:33 PM

To: Shaff, Leanna (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Townsend, Tanya (CI-StPaul); Muenich, Elizabeth (CI-StPaul)
Subject: 950 Cromwell - Fee adjustmest

Leanna,

| just spoke to Tanya in assessments. We took a payment for 950 Cromwell in November of last year and it was sent to
assessment in October.

She told me that a resolution needs to be entered into Legistar so she can remove the assessment on her end, which she
is willing to do. She thought you might be the one to do this??

Thanks,

Al
A.J. Neis, CFI
Fire Inspection Supervisor
City of Saint Paul

A 375 Jackson St. Suite 200



Saint Paul, MN 55101

P: 651-266-8992

F: 651-266-8951

adrian.neis @ci.stpaul.mn.us
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