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Mai Vang - 1091 Cook

From: "David Mortensen"

To: "Mai Vang" , "Marcia Moermond" , "Steve Magner"
Date: 5/23/2011 10:43 AM

Subject: 1091 Cook

Attachments:

Hello everyone,

| wanted to provide you with some information in preparation for tomorrow’s hearing. | have attached the repair estimate and
engineering report for your review. | should have a timeline as well in the near future — however, the expected time to complete
the work is estimated on the attachments. | have confirmed that the property taxes are current, and that the property is being
maintained. | am attempting to obtain pictures for tomorrow.

In addition, the bond is in the works at this point. | understand that my client has approved the placement of the bond, but it is
taking some additional time to coordinate.

If you have any questions, please let me know.

Thanks,
Dave

David R. Mortensen | Attorney

Wl]fmd Geske &Cook CUU]{

LOFESSIONAL ASSOCIAT

8425 Seasons Parkway, Swte 105 | Woodbury, MN 55125
Phone: (651) 209-3317 | Fax: (651) 209-3339
www.wgcmn.com | dmortensen@wgcmn.com

THIS COMMUNICATION IS FROM A DEBT COLLECTOR ATTEMPTING TO COLLECT A DEBT. ANY
INFORMATION OBTAINED WILL BE USED FOR THAT PURPOSE.

This message is intended only for the use of the individual to whom it is addressed, and contains information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient, or the
employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any
unauthorized disclosure, dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us and return the original message to us at the above address by
reply to the sender.
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