Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Monday, July 22, 2024 10:51 AM

To: Jillian Barden

Subject: Re: FW: FW: 159 Granite St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Forward

On Tue, July 16 at 14:02, Consortium wrote:
Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 1:21 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: 159 Granite St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

See attached e-mail.
Based on that e-mail — | put the account on service hold effective 7.1.24.
We had no information prior to that e-mail that 159 Granite St should be on vacancy hold.

Every balance on this account since 10.1.18 has been sent to the City/County for certification.



Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 9:50 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 159 Granite St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Mary,

Please see the information and request from Jillian.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 9:32 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 159 Granite St - (Quarter 1 (January - March)) - Assessment Inquiry

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 159 Granite St. Please forward to Waste Management for their input.



Ticket ID#: 639975

Ticket Requester: Bruce Johnson

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16512302320
Property ID #: 302922430147

Property Address: 159 Granite St

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 1 (January - March)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2024

Pending Assessment Amount: $154.44

Hauler: Waste Management

Ticket Comments:

| show this property has been billed but it has a UDRF hold. Can you verify the date you received/processed hold?

Please provide the following information:
e Name and mailing address on the account
¢ Itemized breakdown of invoice

e Payment history
e Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Jillian

City of Saint Paul

Public Works - Garbage



651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



