Lxdia Campbell

From: Lydia (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Thursday, March 28, 2024 2:33 PM

To: Lydia Campbell

Subject: Re: FW: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

fwd

On Thu, March 28 at 14:30, Lydia Campbell wrote:
Thank you

On Wed, March 27 at 13:31, Consortium wrote:

Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 11:29 AM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

No nothing has changed

Mary Patch



From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 11:26 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: FW: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

Mary,

Please see response from Lydia.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@agmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Lydia (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, March 27, 2024 11:15 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

Thank you.

| just need to confirm that there weren't any changes to service before it goes to another hearing.

On Tue, March 26 at 16:58, Consortium wrote:
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Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2024 4:35 PM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

I know | explained this couple to the City several months ago.

They have since Oct 2018 disputed every quarterly billing — they have sent numerous letters to WM saying
close to the same thing noted below.

They are just angry residents

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2024 4:22 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

Mary,

Please see the information and request from Lydia.
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Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Lydia (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2024 3:38 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 1223 Farrington ST - Assessment Inquiry - WM

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1223 Farrington St. Please forward to WM for their input.

Ticket ID#: 461820

Ticket Requester: Carol Broos

Ticket Requester Email: (if available):

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) : 6514894622
Property ID #: 242923430130

Property Address: 1223 Farrington St

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Q2, Q3, Q4

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2023

Pending Assessment Amount: $85.47 per Q



Hauler: WM

Ticket Comments:

No comments provided from PO. Just a document stating, "Refused For Cause Without Dishonor, And Without
Recourse To Me, As Per The Uniform Commercial Code"

Please provide the following information:
¢ Name and mailing address on the account
e Itemized breakdown of invoice

e Payment history
e Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Lydia

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



