APPLICATION FOR APPEAL

Saint Paul City Council - Legislative Hearings

RECE|VvEr 310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd.
Saint Paul, Minnesota 55102

APR 24 2023 Telephone: (651) 266-8585
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DEPARTMENT QOF SAFETY AND INSPECTIONS
Steve Magner, Manager of Code Enforcement

. Telephone: 651- 266- 8989
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220
CITY OF SAINT PAUL Sain{PauI,MNSSIO.I-ISOG Facstmile: 651- 266- 1919
www.stpaul gov/dsi

April 12, 2023

Customer #:1829179

Pang Yang/Yang Vang Bill #: 1729592

1093 Western Ave N
St Paul MN 55117- 4842

VACANT BUILDING REGISTRATION NOTICE

The premises at 1053 WESTERN AVE N -

has been inspected and found to meet the legal definition of a Vacant Building as described in Saint
Paul Legislative Code, Chapter 43. You are required by law to register this building with the
Department of Safety and Inspections, Vacant Building Division, by filling out and returning the
registration form provided with this letter. You are also required to pay the annual Vacant Building
Registration Fee of _$2,459.00 . The fee is due upon receipt of this letter and must be paid no later
than thirty (30) days from the date of this letter, as required in Saint Paul Legislative Code, Chapter
43. If this building is vacant due to a fire, complete the enclosed registration form and return it to
this office within 30 days.

Payment must be received by May 12, 2023 .

You may pay this registration fee online by going to online.stpaul.gov and selecting the 'Make a
Payment' option. You will need your customer number and bill number to process a payment - both
can be found on this letter.

To pay this invoice by mail please send this registration form along with payment to:

DEPARTMENT OF SAFETY AND INSPECTIONS
375 Jackson Street, Suite 220
Saint Paul, MN 55101- 1806
Do Not Mail Cash

If you wish to pay in person, you may do so from 8:00am to 4:00pm Monday through Friday at the
above address.

You may file an appeal to this fee or registration requirements by contacting the City Clerk's Office
by calling (651)266- 8688. Any appeal of this fee must be made within ten (10) days of the date of
this notice.

If the registration fee is not received in this office within 45 days of the date of this letter, the
full amount owed will be assessed to, and collected with, the taxes for this property as permitted
by Saint Paul Legislative Code Chapter 43.

The Code Enforcement Officer has notified the Building Inspection and Design Section that this
property meets the legal definition of a registered vacant building and in accordance with TLegislative
Code Chapter 33, no permits (except demolition, wrecking and removal permits) will be issued until
the requirements of all applicable ordinances are fulfilled.

An Affirmative Action Equal Oppertunity Employer



To: Kelly Esker <kesker@nefco.net>

Subject: Re: NEFCO Notification - Claim #7005919541 1093 Weste ~Paul, MN

This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the
sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Kelly,

We have a few options: The first is, the earliest | can meet you on Friday is probably about 1pm, otherwise, if it is
outside of that timeframe | can possibly talk to my supervisor to see if he will let me out to meet you and give you
access, then return back to work. My workplace is about 10 minutes from my parents' home so it shouldn't take me
long to get there and back.

The other route is, | can definitely give you the access code to the lockbox for the property which has the keys to the
front and back entrance-- and if you are able to send the consent via email we can get that taken care of prior to your
visit.

Or lastly, | can see if one of my siblings can meet you out there, sign the consent and also open the lockbox for you to
do your inspection.

Let me know what you prefer-

Thanks,

On Thu, Apr 13, 2023 at 9:29 AM Kelly Esker <kesker@nefco.net> wrote:
Ms Xeng Vang & Mr. Yang Vang,

Xeng, thank you for the text message. 1 will call you at 215 pm today for the phone interview. It should
not last longer then a % hour. | would like to schedule the scene exam for tomorrow, mid to late
morning. Could one of you meet me to receive access to the occupancy and sign the access consent
form?

Sincerely,

Fire /m«/fﬁjm‘% Corductes

Kelly L. Esker, JAAI - CFI N

Fire Analyst - Wisconsin 7:/7{63/ ﬁ/ / /7// 2022

89 Pickering Road, Rochester NH 03839

Office (800) 675-8500 /{//1/

Cell (715) 572-0644 ) oo 1)
Email: kesker@nefco.net Y cosdd Tot2d Lss op %// 2 ze> 3{ )
WI License # 12461-63 persty Fire Leport (Fl
From: xeng vang <xvang0488@gmail.com> i 1//2_?2!’/2& é%mbrﬂih -
Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2023 8:42 AM 'ﬁ; AP Fo 7&;@7“6 :

To: Ken Horstman <kenneth.horstman@farmersinsurance.com>
Cc: Kelly Esker <kesker@nefco.net>
Subject: Re: NEFCO Notification - Claim #7005919541 1093 Western Avenue North St. Paul, MN

This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize
the sender and know the content is safe.

Thank you Kelly and Ken,
Kelly, | sent you a message late last night-- | will not be available today (Thursday) However, anytime after 2pm this
Friday or next Monday | should be available. If you need to access the property | would be more than happy to give

you the access code to the lockbox. Otherwise, | can meet you there for an interview if needed.

Please let me know if you have any other questions.



