From: Wendy
To: Xoanna Zimoy
Ce: John Ray
Subject: Re: 655 Jessamine - one more item
Date: Thursday, April 13, 2023 9:37:32 PM
Attachments: Iimage001 pog

Sampie Afficavi doc

3johnals;jusiissuedmosefnn¢we" d inis in a cashiers check on Weds this week
4Thuew1ﬂbemomermdtopmupmymeﬁmdsdmdtmhlexsdmostcomplewd

Attached please see john Rays payment issued to SandStone on Weds as well as the breaking ground pics for drain tile
I am aware that electrical inspection Randy will be at the home tomorrow

C will be ting HVAC reg the 2nd permit closing tomorrow

As well as he is calling Clint to address that mechanical aspect

They feel very solid about completing in a very short time period

Thank you for your ideration in this d







Wendy Ray
Wray1322@yahoo com
Wendy ray@Norwex biz
763)742-9324

On Apr 13,2023, at 3:25 PM, Joanna Zimny <joanna zimny(@ci stpaul mn us> wrote:

Hi Wendy,

Sorry for the hassle on this stuff, Ms Moermond would like an updated affidavit as the account numbers don t match the original affidavit submitted I have attached a
blank one — it does NOT need to be notarized It should reference the checking account you submitted

Also originally Mr Ray had submitted a money market account too (attached), if an updated one of those could be submitted that would be great This is because typically
Ms Moermond doesn t accept checking accounts since the amounts fluctuate

Thanks so much,
Joanna

Joanna Zimny

Legislative Hearing Executive Assistant
Legislative Hearing Office
Pronouns: she/her/hers
Saint Paul City Hall

Suite 310

15 W. Kellogg Blvd.

Saint Paul, MN 55102
P:651-266-8585
Joanna.zimny@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www StPaul.gov

5:07 PM

Accounts




MARKET MONITOR *9363
Available** $585,071 .81

Current $585,071.81

ONB PERSONAL CHECKING *3615

Available** $5,21 /-85
Current $6,012.26

We’ve reopened
our lobbies.

Appointments encouraged. Masks required.

DETAILS HERE

** This balance may include overdraft or line of
credit funds.
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