Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 1:33 PM

To: Support (Zendesk)

Cc: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: Fwd: 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) -
Assessment Inquiry

Attachments: 802 MOUND ST INVOICE.pdf; 802 MOUND ST Q2 INVOICE.pdf; 802 MOUND ST.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please see Highland update.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Highland Sanitation <info@highlandsanitation.com>

Date: December 14, 2022 at 12:34:24 PM CST

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment
Inquiry

Please see attached history and invoices.

Sincerely,

Susan Stewant
Highland Sanitation & Recycling Inc.

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 10:43 AM

To: info@highlandsanitation.com

Subject: FW: 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment
Inquiry

Sue,
Please see the information and request from Clare.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.



grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Clare (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 10:35 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>; Sarah Haas <sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 2 (April - June)) - Assessment Inquiry

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106. Please
forward to Highland Sanitation for their input.

Ticket ID#: 15047

Ticket Requester: Sadek Tahirou

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) tycoonflip@gmail.com
Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16126364190
Property ID #: 332922330016

Property Address: 802 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 2 (April - June)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2022

Pending Assessment Amount: $111.07

Hauler: Highland Sanitation

Ticket Comments: Please provide the following information from Q2 - Q4 2022:

- Service Level

- ltemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history

- Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage




