Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 2:59 PM

To: Support (Zendesk)

Cc: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) -
Assessment Inquiry

Attachments: 884 MOUND ST HISTORY.pdf; 884 MOUND ST INVOICE.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please see attached from Highland.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Highland Sanitation <info@highlandsanitation.com>

Sent: Friday, December 23, 2022 2:47 PM

To: 'Greg Revering' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

| have attached the history and the invoice.

This address never pays his bill and threatens to sue everyone. Ask Sarah about Larry.

From: Greg Revering [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, December 22, 2022 4:08 PM

To: Sue Stewart

Subject: Fwd: 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Sue,
Please see the information and request from Clare.

Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:

From: "Clare (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Date: December 22, 2022 at 4:00:51 PM CST




To: Consortium <grevering.sph(@gmail.com>, Sarah Haas <sarah.haas@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) -
Assessment Inquiry

Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage(@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106. Please
forward to Highland Sanitation for their input.

Ticket ID#: 15935

Ticket Requester: Larry Hall

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16517761965
Property ID #: 332922330031

Property Address: 884 Mound St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 3 (July - September)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2022

Pending Assessment Amount: $68.21

Hauler: Highland Sanitation

Ticket Comments: Please provide the following information for Q3 - Q4 2022:

- Service level at the property

- Any missed pick ups

- Dates of service holds applied to the account (if any)
- Iltemized breakdown of invoice

- Payment history

- Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage




