Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 3:15 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Subject: RE: 244 Maryland Ave E/302922140093

The payment was received in our Treasury Office by ACH Payment on December 23, 2021 but wasn’t applied until now.

From: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 3:10 PM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: 244 Maryland Ave E/302922140093

Reason for reduction?

Mai Vang

Pronouns: She/Her

City Council Offices - Legislative Hearings

15 W Kellogg Blvd, 310 City Hall

Saint Paul, MN 55102

M: (651) 266-8585 | D: (651) 266-8563

Legislative Hearing Appeals - www.stpaul.gov/legislative-hearings

FY SAINT PAUL
LLLLE MINNESOTA

From: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 3:04 PM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: 244 Maryland Ave E/302922140093

Can you put together a RES to Reduce.

CRT2207

228206

Levied 4/6/2022

AR 22-23

Please reduce the original charge of $892 to $735.

Thank you and Have a Nice Day!

Tanya ) Panzer
Office of Financial Services - Assessments
15 W Kellogg Blvd, 700 City Hall



Saint Paul, MN 55102
M: (651) 266-8858 Option 1| D: (651) 266-6153
Assessment Look Up- www.stpaul.gov/assessments
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From: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 10:04 AM

To: Panzer, Tanya (CI-StPaul) <tanya.panzer@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Solomon, Michael (CI-StPaul) <michael.solomon@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul)
<Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

Tanya,

| just found out about this payment but it was paid before the assessment came to us and was due to DSI. Who would
do a resolution to remove the fees? The assessment is already levied so | know it needs to be approved by
Council. Attached is the receipt for the payment that came 12/23.

Would you mind taking care of this?

Thank you,
Lynn

Lynn M. Rolf
Assessments Supervisor
Office of Financial Services - Assessments

700 City Hall
SAINT PAUL 15 West Kellogg Boulevard
MINNESOTA Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8851
lynn.rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov/assessments

From: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul) <Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, April 26, 2022 9:31 AM

To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Rolf, Lynn (CI-StPaul) <Lynn.Rolf@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Solomon, Michael (CI-StPaul)
<michael.solomon@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

Patti,



Following up on this last missing cash receipt for 12-23-2021. We left off on this one the Friday before
Easter, but | was messaging you on Teams. So, | am putting my message below. It is for a $735 portion of
a State ACH deposit for a Fire Cert. Please let me know the cash receipt number when finished.

| was given the address of 244 Maryland Ave. E., St. Paul, 55117, by the contact at the State. He had said,
probably for Maryland Avenue Truck Station.

Thanks,
Bianca

From: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Friday, April 15, 2022 3:25 PM

To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

I'm talking with the State right now to get the PID.

From: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Friday, April 15, 2022 3:22 PM

To: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul) <Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

We don’t use customer numbers, but maybe DSI could help on that. Do you want me to contact them? Although, the
request might have to come from you, | don’t know.

P

From: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul) <Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Friday, April 15, 2022 3:16 PM

To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

Are you able to find it under Customer Number? Is there someone in DSI or Fire that can look up that
way.

From: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Friday, April 15, 2022 3:14 PM

To: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul) <Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: RE: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

Bianca —

There is nothing | can see on the paperwork that identifies an address or Property ID#. | need one or the other to find
this, | think.

Patti

From: Lazowski, Bianca (CI-StPaul) <Bianca.Lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Sent: Friday, April 15, 2022 3:10 PM




To: DeMay, Patti (CI-StPaul) <Patti.DeMay@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Fire Cert Occupancy MN DOT 1618262 - Cust 1021876

Hi Patti,

Do you have coding to cash receipt this. The deposit came in on 12.23.21 with a Water deposit. | need

coding for the $735.00 portion.

Thanks,
Bianca

32.441.71 | 0007127526

SAINT PAUL
MINNESOTA

1212372021 US BANK NA

Bianca Lazowski

Cash Manager

Pronouns: She/Her/Hers

Office of Financial Services

15 W Kellogg Blvd., Ste. 700
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: (651) 266-8779
bianca.lazowski@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.StPaul.gov
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