Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Monday, December 30, 2024 11:22 AM

To: Jillian Barden

Subject: Re: FW: 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) -

Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please See Attached

On Fri, December 20 at 9:46, Consortium wrote:

Please see Republic update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Sent: Friday, December 20, 2024 8:29 AM

To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: RE: 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment
Inquiry

Hello,

Currently there is no active account on site. As of 11/1/24 we got an email from the
city stating this property is vacant. We closed it and no one has called to set up
service.



However, Pauline Ross account still has an outstanding balance of $89.53.

Thanks,

Frances Estrella

Municipal Administrator

10729 Town Square Dr NE Ste 180
Blaine, MN 55449

e festrella@republicservices.com
o 612.464.2723

c 612.516.4833

w RepublicServices.com

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2024 6:39 PM

To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Cc: Romack Franklin <rfranklin3@republicservices.com>

Subject: Fwd: 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment
Inquiry




This Message Is From an External Sender -
Report Suspicious

This message came from outside your organization.

Frances,
Please see the information and request from Jillian.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul)" <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Date: December 19, 2024 at 4:28:35 PM CST

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment
Inquiry

Reply-To: City of Saint Paul <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119. Please forward to
Republic Services for their input.

Ticket ID#: 801835

Ticket Requester: Xeng Chang

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16515007971
Property ID #: 262922230112

Property Address: 1783 Ames Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55119



Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 3 (July - September)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2024

Pending Assessment Amount: $308.94

Hauler: Republic Services

Ticket Comments:

PO was unaware he needed to place hold when he purchased home. Can you confirm cart size, if there was a
cart on site when he purchased property, and any communication with PO
Please provide the following information:

¢ Name and mailing address on the account

e ltemized breakdown of invoice

e Payment history

e Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Jillian

City of Saint Paul

Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us

stpaul.gov/garbage




