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Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2025 12:17 PM
To: Jillian Barden
Subject: Re: FW: Multiple Properties - Q3 2024 Assessment Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 
 

see attached 

 

On Mon, January 20 at 8:04, Consortium wrote:  

Please see Republic update.  

   

Greg Revering  

Chief Manager  

St. Paul Haulers LLC.  

grevering.sph@gmail.com  

   

763-295-2054  

   

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>  
Sent: Monday, January 20, 2025 7:55 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Multiple Properties - Q3 2024 Assessment Inquiry  

  

Hello,  

Customer didn’t pay invoice till 8/2, being late. Yes, you can remove the assessment.  

   

Thanks,  
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Frances Estrella    

Municipal Administrator  

   

10729 Town Square Dr NE Ste 180  

Blaine, MN 55449  

e   festrella@republicservices.com  

o   612.464.2723  

c   612.516.4833  

w   RepublicServices.com  

   

 

   

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2025 3:38 PM 
To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com> 
Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com> 
Subject: FW: Multiple Properties - Q3 2024 Assessment Inquiry  

  

Frances,  Pl ease see the i nformati on and req ues t fr om Jillian.  Greg R evering C hief  Manager St.  Paul  Haulers  LLC. gr everi ng.   sph@   gmail.   com  763-295- 2054 From : Jillian Bar den (City  of Sai nt Paul) <support@   sai ntpaul.   zendesk .   com> Sent:  Friday,  

ZjQcmQR YFpfptBannerStart  

 

This Message Is From an External Sender  

This message came from outside your organization.  
    Report Suspicious     
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ZjQcmQR YFpfptBannerEnd  

Frances,  

Please see the information and request from Jillian.  

   

   

Greg Revering  

Chief Manager  

St. Paul Haulers LLC.  

grevering.sph@gmail.com  

   

763-295-2054  

   

From: Jillian Barden (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>  
Sent: Friday, January 17, 2025 1:51 PM 
To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com> 
Subject: Multiple Properties - Q3 2024 Assessment Inquiry  

   

Hello,  

   

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 796 Hague Ave, 611 Marshall Ave, 63 Milton St, 844 Hague Ave, Saint 

Paul, Minnesota. Please forward to Republic Services for their input.   

   

Ticket ID#: 925721  

Ticket Requester: Nathaniel Khaliq  

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)  

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16513350743  
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Property ID #:  

Property Address:  796 Hague Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55104  

Quarter Pending Assessment is for: -  

Billing year for Pending Assessment:  -  

Pending Assessment Amount: $  

Hauler: Republic Services  

Ticket Comments:   

   

PO owes multiple small assessments for:   

 796 Hague Ave  

 611 Marshall Ave  

 63 Milton St  

 844 Hague Ave  

PO reports he paid over the phone, and he is not sure why these amounts were not paid for when he called in. Can 

we please remove these fees? 

   

Please provide the following information:  

 Name and mailing address on the account  

 Itemized breakdown of invoice  

 Payment history  

 Contact with property owner  

Thank you,  

   

Jillian  

---  

City of Saint Paul  

Public Works - Garbage  

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us  
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stpaul.gov/garbage  

                                                                                                      C onversati on ID:  6f39b632- d50c- 11ef- b7fb- 84bb9b636ea1 6f39b632-d50c- 11ef- b7fb- 84bb9b636ea1 03c10c1  


