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Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 12:53 PM
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Chao, Diana (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: FW: FW: 877 Clark St - WM 7/25 LH

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
Please see Mary’s update on account number request. 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
 

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 12:43 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: FW: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Okay his old account number was  00018‐53624‐03007and his new account number is  00021‐88978‐63006. 
 
Mary Patch   
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 12:09 PM 
To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Mary, 
See Diana’s request for account numbers below. 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
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From: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:46 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
 
 

From: Chao, Diana (CI‐StPaul)  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:45 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Ok perfect, thank you. I will add this to our legislative hearing record. 
 
Can you please provide the old account number and new account number? I want to make sure the property owner has 
this info so he can pay the right account moving forward. 
 
Thank you! 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul)  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:42 AM 
To: Chao, Diana (CI‐StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:42 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
Please see Mary’s update below. 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
 

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 11:21 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Okay  ‐ he paid $192.16 on an old account he had with us prior to the change over in St Paul  ‐ that money was moved to 
his new St Paul Account – that payment covered his 4th Qtr billing (this was all done in Nov 2018) 
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Then he made a total of $552.84 in payments on that old account again and that money was reversed back to the credit 
card he used to pay us with (this was all done in Nov 2018). 
 
So we never were paid for 1st Qtr 2019 nor were we paid for 2nd Qtr 2019 and there are no payments sitting on that old 
account at this time.  
If he did make a payment of $233.49 – I will need to see proof of that.  
 
Thanks 
Mary Patch   
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 10:44 AM 
To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Mary, 
Please see Chris’s request below. 
 

Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763‐295‐2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 10:41 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Chao, Diana (CI‐StPaul) <Diana.Chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Can you have WM look at this and send a response back? 
 
Thanks  
 
Chris  
 

From: Chao, Diana (CI‐StPaul)  
Sent: Wednesday, July 24, 2019 10:40 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 877 Clark St ‐ WM 7/25 LH 
 
Hello Greg, 
 
We have a pending Q1 2019 assessment of $233.49 for 877 Clark St. Taylor Johnson states: 
 
“I literally have a bill I paid to WMW for this time period...” 
 
But in his hearing request, he attached a copy of the Q4 2018 bill. Can you please ask WM for a payment history for this 
address? Did they make a payment for Q1 2019? 
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This needs to be entered today, so it would be great if we can get a response ASAP. 
 
Thanks! 
 

Diana Chao 
Solid Waste Programs Specialist 
Saint Paul Public Works 
25 West 4th Street 
1500 City Hall Annex 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-6216 
diana.chao@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

 
 

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.  


