Mai Vang

From: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings

Sent: Wednesday, December 10, 2025 8:37 AM

To: Tracy Anderson

Cc: Mai Vang; Tanya Panzer; Lynn Rolf; Lindsay Butterfield
Subject: RE: File# J2527R - 1871 Old Hudson Rd

Hello Tracy,

Once again, our system for looking up information is still down. | am rescheduling you to March 24, 2026
Legislative Hearing via telephone hearing between 9am-noon at 651-353-6652. Your City Council
Public Hearing will be April 8, 2026 at 3:30 p.m. in Room 330 City Hall. Note, you must attend the
Legislative Hearing first.

Please confirm receipt of this email and my apology for the inconvenience.

Thank you,

Mai Vang

(She, her)

Legislative Hearing Coordinator | St Paul City Council
M: (651) 266-8585 ; D: (651) 266-8563

310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd, St Paul, MN 55102

'Y SAINT PAUL
LLLLE MINNESOTA

From: Tracy Anderson <mrstanderson@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, September 8, 2025 10:44 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: File# J2527R

You don't often get email from mrstanderson@gmail.com. Learn why this is important

| am looking for confirmation that either this file has been closed, or if itis on tomorrow's hearing?
| have left several messages regarding this.

The piano that was dumped from property 1895 Old Hudson Road (NOT my property) onto our hill, and
was removed by our personal contractor not the City.
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| had attempted to work with the property owner to resolve the case, he informed me that his son would
take care of it, Later | learned that his version of taking care of it was to call the City of St Paul. Which led
to our getting Notice, as soon as the Notice was received | contracted and paid for the removal of the
piano.

Below are images of the offense in action. Our contractor is Donny Bateman at 612-670-2415, who is
available to affirm that he completed the work.

Thank you in advance for your assistance in this matter,
Sincerely,

Tracy Anderson
Property Owner at 1871 Old Hudson Road, St Paul, 55119



