
From: Paul Barthol
To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council
Subject: Re: 2079 Bayard Ave - Ratification of Assessment
Date: Tuesday, November 17, 2020 5:06:09 PM

I will keep trying to pay 0n-line. Your website is down.

paul barthol

On Tue, Nov 17, 2020 at 1:50 PM *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-
Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

Your payment should be postmarked today and sent to the address below.  It can also be
paid online today.  After today, it will be part of your 2021 tax bill.

 

City of Saint Paul Assessments

700 City Hall

15 Kellogg Boulevard West

Saint Paul, MN  55102

 

Racquel Naylor

City Council Offices

Suite 310 City Hall

15 Kellogg Boulevard West

Saint Paul, MN  55102

Phone: 651-266-8560

Fax:  651-266-8574

 

From: Paul Barthol <bartholpaul4@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2020 5:14 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_Contact-Council <Contact-Council@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Jeri Barthol
<bartholj75@gmail.com>; Paul Barthol <bartholpaul4@gmail.com>
Subject: Ratification of Assessment
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Regarding:

Property Address 2079 Bayard Ave, St Paul, MN 55116

Property ID Number: 08-28-23-44-0020

Council District Planning District # 200025
 

We have received your notice stating you sent an invoice on
August 28th; and, since we have not paid an assessment, it
will appear on my 2021 property tax statement and include
interest.
 

Not only have we not received any such notice, I have
researched the st paul.gov/assessment website and there is no
such assessment listed for the above property. We have no
problem paying a reasonable assessment.  We object to being
penalized for late payment of an assessment never (either in
the mail or digitally) received.
 

Please respond as soon as possible ;
 

Sincerely
 

Jera Giesen Barthol

Paul A Barthol

2079 Bayard Ave, St Paul, MN 55116-1234

http://paul.gov/assessment


 

 


