Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: CouncilHearing (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 3:21 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Cc: Vang, Mai (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: File# CG2001A2, Assessment : 200101

Ta for 7/16 LH and 7/22 CPH

From: Rupinder Singh <rupinder901@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, July 3, 2020 1:36 PM

To: CouncilHearing (CI-StPaul) <CouncilHearing@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: File## CG2001A2, Assessment : 200101

Property ID # 04-28-23-43-0149
Address : 1701 St Clair Ave
Hello

| am enquiring about this $600.74 charge for garbage services from Oct to Dec 2019. | am not sure why | am paying
$200 per month for garage service as this seems incorrect for | just made a payment for $279 for the last three months.

Moreover, | live in a duplex which is incorrectly classified with city as a Triplex and am working to rectify it. Because of
the triplex classificaion, its my understanding that | am being forced to have three garbage bins and three recycling bins.
| am a civic minded oerson with a very small waste footprint who composts and | dont need 3 of each such bins. Why
would I not get a choice to use the number of bins i need. In any case | am working with the city on classification back to
duplex so at least one of the garbage and recycling bins is taken off.

In spite of the above, 600.74 seems high. Can you break this down for me what are the accumulation of charges levelled
to bring it to this dollar figure number

Thanks
Rupinder
612 814 1923



