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Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2020 2:08 PM
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul); Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: 1320 Wilson Ave. 

Please add to AR file. 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 

 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI‐StPaul)  
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2020 5:11 PM 
To: *CI‐StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI‐StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1320 Wilson Ave.  
 
Spoke to property owner. He stated that he has already paid his assessments and does not wish to contest them. 
Therefore I am not going to create a TA file for this account. 
 
Thank you! 
 
 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works 
800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street 
Saint Paul, MN 55102 
P: 651-266-8862 
F: 651-266-6222 
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 

www.stpaul.gov/garbage 
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From: *CI‐StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, July 9, 2020 12:52 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI‐StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Pillsbury, Clare (CI‐StPaul) 
<Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Vang, Mai (CI‐StPaul) <mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 1320 Wilson Ave.  
 
Need ta for 7/16 
Ar 20‐81 for 7/22 
 
Also a Q1 Ta needs prep 
 

From: Heintz, Polly (CI‐StPaul) <polly.heintz@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 12:30 PM 
To: Moermond, Marcia (CI‐StPaul) <marcia.moermond@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Vang, Mai (CI‐StPaul) 
<mai.vang@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: 1320 Wilson Ave.  
 
Mohammad Hadi, My property in St. Paul is  
1320 Wilson Ave 
St Paul, MN 55106 
 
Well, I have been paying my garbage bills every time and I am getting a harassment letter, or notice, I call it a 
certification of assessment. I paid already to the city, $350.00 last week. Which they said I did not pay my garbage. I 
always send my money to Waste Management.  
 
Sometimes they do not process the card numbers I give them properly and the (bank?) told me they were making a 
mistake. It was the garbage company’s mistake and they were not telling me that the card did not go through. They just 
sending a letter to you guys. This I have complained many, many times. I even talked to Jane Price. Now I paid three 
payments, three.  1, 2, 3 I paid already. And now I have another one saying that I did not pay the $160.91 I already paid… 
again.  
 
Please, please, please. I want this city to stop harassing me of this bills.  
Thank you. Bye. 
 

From: Assessment_English (CI‐StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 10:02 AM 
To: #CI‐StPaul_Ward7 <Ward7@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: Voice Mail (1 minute and 53 seconds) 
 
Please transcribe the attached voicemail. Forward this email to Marcia and Mai, with the property address and 
assessment number added to the Subject line, and the transcription in the body of the email. Feel free to let me know if 
you have questions. Marcia would like these done as soon as possible. 
 
Thank you! 
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Katie Burger 

Executive Assistant 

Saint Paul City Council 
15 West Kellogg Boulevard, Suite 310 

Saint Paul, MN 55102 

P: 651‐266‐8567 

F: 651‐266‐8574 

kathryn.burger@ci.stpaul.mn.us 

 
 

Making Saint Paul the Most Livable City in America

 
 

From: +1 612‐360‐9338 <+1 612‐360‐9338>  
Sent: Saturday, July 4, 2020 12:15 AM 
To: Assessment_English (CI‐StPaul) <Assessment_English@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: Voice Mail (1 minute and 53 seconds) 
 
You received a voice mail from Cell Phone MN. 
 
 

Set Up Voice Mail 


