Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Wednesday, April 29, 2020 9:26 AM

To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

Cc: Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)

Subject: FW: FW: 1510 Concordia Avenue - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Please add to the file for 1510 Concordia Ave.

Thanks!

Clare Pillsbury

Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

.... F: 651-266-6222

Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
City in Amgrica

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 3:25 PM

To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Subject: FW: FW: 1510 Concordia Avenue - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Clare,
Please see breakdown from Mary.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>
Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 3:12 PM




To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: FW: 1510 Concordia Avenue - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

$9.01 — Trash tax (9.75%)

$25.86 — Ramsey County tax (28%)

$74.37 — Three months of 96 gal trash service at $24.79 per month.
$18.00 for six bags of extra trash picked up on 7.29.19.

$6.32 Oct finance charge

$6.32 Nov finance charge

$6.32 Dec finance charge

Minus $.77 credit for overcharge on finance charges in 3™ Qtr.
Total due $145.43

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 27,2020 2:10 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1510 Concordia Avenue - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Mary,
Please see information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 1:30 PM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: 1510 Concordia Avenue - (Q4 2019) Assessment Error/Complaint Inquiry

Please forward to Waste Management:

Property Address & PID: 1510 CONCORDIA AVENUE (PID: 342923330013)
Property Owner: Strouth, Anthony

Phone Number or Email: 469-955-0574; midwayrentalscompany@gmail.com
Pending Assessment Amount: $145.43

Quarter Pending Assessment is For: Garbage Service Q4 Oct 1-Dec 31 2019

Summary of Issue: Property owner currently has service for a 94-gallon cart at the property. Can you break down the
assessment amount of $145.43 so that we can see what the resident was charged for in Quarter 4 2019?

Thank you! As the legislative hearing for this file is this week, please provide an answer by tomorrow (Tuesday, April 28)
at 10:00 am, if possible.



SAINT Clare Pillsbury

SURE L Management Assistant 1

Saint Paul Public Works

800 City Hall Annex, 25 West 4th Street
Saint Paul, MN 55102

P: 651-266-8862

F: 651-266-6222
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us

£ Bl

www.stpaul.gov/garbage

The Maost Livable
Cll;r' in America

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



