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Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 10:01 AM
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Subject: RE: FW: 1180 Lane Pl

Got it. Thank you Kim! I will go ahead and request that it be removed. 
 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 

   
   
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 7:58 AM 
To: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) 
<Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Clare, 
Please see update from Kim. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 30, 2021 6:36 AM 
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To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com> 
Cc: Williams, Tim (DFW) <twillia5@wm.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
That is correct Clair Q4 2020 
 
Thank you 
 
Kim Shannon | Operations Support/Administrative Assistant/Scale Operator 

 
309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN  55103 
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552  | E: kshannon@wm.com  
Connect with us:     AdvancedDisposal.com     Facebook      YouTube 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 2:47 PM 
To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com> 
Cc: Williams, Tim (DFW) <twillia5@wm.com> 
Subject: FW: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Kim, 
Please see question from Clare. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 1:40 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com; Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Thank you! I just wanted to confirm, before I remove this, that this is for Q4 2020, correct? 
 
 

 

Clare Pillsbury 
Management Assistant I 
Saint Paul Public Works  
Pronouns: she/her/hers 
Saint Paul City Hall Annex 
15 W. Kellogg Blvd.  
Saint Paul, MN 55102  
P: 651-266-8862   
Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us
www.StPaul.gov  
  

 

 



3

   
   
 
 
 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 1:34 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
Please see update from Kim. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 1:07 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Sorry yes remove. 
 
Thank you 
 
Kim Shannon | Operations Support/Administrative Assistant/Scale Operator 

 
309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN  55103 
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552  | E: kshannon@wm.com  
Connect with us:     AdvancedDisposal.com     Facebook      YouTube 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 12:56 PM 
To: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Kim, 
Please see question from Chris. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
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St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 12:46 PM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: RE: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Kim, 
 
When you say “disregard” you mean remove right? Just want to be sure we are all on the same page. 
 
chris 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 12:22 PM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Cc: Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul) <Clare.Pillsbury@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: 1180 Lane Pl 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
Please see information from Kim. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Shannon, Kimberly <kshannon@wm.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 29, 2021 11:20 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Cc: Williams, Tim (DFW) <twillia5@wm.com>; Miron, Julie <jmiron@wm.com> 
Subject: 1180 Lane Pl 
 
Good morning, 
There was an issue with an adjustment with Amanda’s account please disregard tax roll in the amount of 
$202.11. I am correcting account.  
 
Thank you 
 
Kim Shannon | Operations Support/Administrative Assistant/Scale Operator 
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309 Como Avenue | Saint Paul | MN  55103 
T: 651-768-5270 | F: 651-487-8552  | E: kshannon@wm.com  
Connect with us:     AdvancedDisposal.com     Facebook      YouTube 
 

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.  


