Jillian Barden

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 10:25 AM

To: Jillian Barden

Subject: Re: FW: FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment
Inquiry

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

see attached

On Fri, February 28 at 16:15, Consortium wrote:
Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@agmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2025 10:00 AM

To: 'grevering.sph@gmail.com' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

He hasn’t contacted us - how many times do | need to say it

Mary Patch



From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2025 9:50 AM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

Mary,

Please see question from Jillian.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Wednesday, February 26, 2025 2:22 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

Was he upset the last time he called in?

On Wed, February 26 at 14:06, Consortium wrote:
Please see WM update

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com>
Date: February 26, 2025 at 8:34:07 AM CST




To: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

| thought that same thing - but you contact us at the time it took place you don’t wait 8 months to let someone
know.

What has he been doing with his trash this whole time?

As | stated on my last e-mail there has been no communication with him.

Mary Patch

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 25, 2025 8:19 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

Please see response from Jillian

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Date: February 25, 2025 at 3:00:53 PM CST

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry
Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

It's a small cart. | wonder if it fell into the truck. Is it a rear load or side load? What was the communication
like before 8 months ago?



Was the last time he called in, he was upset enough to make him think you would take the cart? Maybe the
cart went missing/fell into truck around the same time and it was a coincidence

On Tue, February 25 at 13:26, Consortium wrote:
Please see WM update

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Patch, Mary" <mpatch@wm.com>

Date: February 25, 2025 at 11:55:46 AM CST

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Subject: RE: FW: FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment

Inquiry

So what are we supposed to do with this account - there is no ticket or communication on his account to
remove a cart.

There is no communication at all - so it this unit was to be put on hold for any reason he never called or
sent us any paperwork.

We have had the Upper Unit on vacancy hold since Jan 2020.

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2025 6:02 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment
Inquiry

Mary,

Please see response from Jillian.



Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage) <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2025 8:54 AM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: Re: FW: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

He says WM took the cart 8 months ago

On Mon, February 17 at 6:13, Consortium wrote:

Please see WM update.

Greg Revering
Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>
Sent: Friday, February 14, 2025 5:23 PM




To: 'Greg Revering' <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

Yes there are and did he give you a reason for those - they aren’t because the driver is missing him.

He just hasn’t put out his cart

Mary Patch

From: Greg Revering <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, February 14, 2025 4:46 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry

Mary,
Please see the information and request from Jillian

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jillian Barden (Public Works Garbage)" <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Date: February 14, 2025 at 11:11:43 AM CST

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117 - (-) - Assessment Inquiry
Reply-To: Public Works Garbage <garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Hello,

We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117. Please
forward to Waste Management for their input.



Ticket ID#: 966765
Ticket Requester: Roger W Stadler

Ticket Requester Email: (if available) pallydoll@yahoo.com

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +16517075897
Property ID #: 302922120022

Property Address: 1122 Jackson St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55117
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Q4

Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2024

Pending Assessment Amount: $ 86.49

Hauler: Waste Management

Ticket Comments:

Can you confirm any cart not outs, or cart pickups in Q4 and Q3

Please provide the following information:
e Name and mailing address on the account
e Itemized breakdown of invoice
e Payment history

e Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Jillian

City of Saint Paul

Public Works - Garbage

651-266-6101 | garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us




stpaul.gov/garbage

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.



