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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 11:13 AM
To: Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul); Zimny, Joanna (CI-StPaul); Moermond, Marcia (CI-StPaul)
Subject: FW: FW: LH today- 2008 Ivy

 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 10:26 AM 
To: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Subject: FW: FW: LH today- 2008 Ivy 
 

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization. 

 
Chris, 
Please see Mary’s update. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 10:10 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: RE: FW: LH today- 2008 Ivy 
 
I don’t show any payment on their account that would have come from Berquist  
If he did send one and it was cashed he would have to send us a copy of it. 
 
Mary Patch 
WM 
 

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 9:21 AM 
To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: LH today- 2008 Ivy 
 
Mary, 
Please see request below. 
 
Greg Revering  
Chief Manager 
St. Paul Haulers LLC. 
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grevering.sph@gmail.com 
 
763-295-2054 
 

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@ci.stpaul.mn.us>  
Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 8:23 AM 
To: grevering.sph@gmail.com 
Subject: LH today- 2008 Ivy 
 
Hi Greg, 
 
We have a legislative hearing scheduled for 2008 Ivy Ave for a Q2 assessment of $112.61.  The resident stated they paid 
this to Berquist.   
 
Does have WM have any record of the payment? 
 
This is for a hearing today… 
 
Chris   

Recycling is a good thing. Please recycle any printed emails.  


