Mai Vang

From: *Cl-StPaul_LegislativeHearings

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2025 8:44 AM

To: ‘mike norby"

Subject: RE: Ratification of assessment File J2503R #258502 - 815 Holton St

Your hearing will be on February 4, 2024 via teleconference call between 10AM-noon. Please provide
a phone number for me to call you into the hearing. Our caller ID will show as 612-315-7905. Note, you
cannot call into this number if you miss our call. We will leave a message and call you back.

From: mike norby <mikenorby23@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2025 7:57 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Ratification of assessment File J2503R #258502 - 815 Holton St

Yes absolutely. I've spent 3 summers cleaning up the alleyway of not only my property but the 3 nearby properties. |
have photos to prove this. | never received any letters telling me to pick up my bags of leaves faster. | always waited till |
had a truck full until bringing them to the refuse dump

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Friday, January 24, 2025, 7:50 AM, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
wrote:

Mr. Norby,

Here are documents related to the clean up done by DSI contractor. If you still want to
appeal, let me know and | will schedule you for a Legislative Hearing.

(She, her)
Legislative Hearing Coordinator St Paul City Council

M: (651) 266-8585 ; D: (651) 266-8563

310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd, St Paul, MN 55102
SAINT PAUL
Ll MINNESOTA



From: mike norby <mikenorby23@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, January 24, 2025 6:23 AM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Re: Ratification of assessment File J2503R #258502

mikenorby23@yahoo.com. Learn why this is important

815 Holton street

St. Paul 55104

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Friday, January 24, 2025, 6:21 AM, *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
<LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> wrote:

What is the property address you are referencing?

(She, her)

Legislative Hearing Coordinator St Paul City Council
M: (651) 266-8585 ; D: (651) 266-8563

310 City Hall, 15 W. Kellogg Blvd, St Paul, MN 55102

SAINT PAUL
LN MINNESOTA

From: mike norby <mikenorby23@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 23, 2025 3:33 PM

To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings <LegislativeHearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: Ratification of assessment File J2503R #258502

mikenorby23@yahoo.com. Learn why this is important

| just received this today that says | owe $396.00 for rubbish and clean up? | can promise
you this was not from anything on my property. My alleyway | have landscaped and



have never left anything laying around back there that | didn’t dispose of myself. | even
cleaned 3 of my neighbors alleyway areas. Can someone please look into this?
Thank you

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone




