Pillsbury, Clare (CI-StPaul)

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Sent: Tuesday, December 21, 2021 8:06 AM

To: Support (Zendesk)

Cc: Haas, Sarah (Cl-StPaul); Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: FW: 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) -

Assessment Inquiry

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Think Before You Click: This email originated outside our organization.

Please see update from Republic Services.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 21, 2021 7:39 AM

To: grevering.sph@gmail.com

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: RE: 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Good Morning,

Q3 2021: Previous Owner:
- Billing: $69.01 + $10.35 (late fee) = $79.36
- Size: 32gal
- Payment: $0.00
- Contact: No contact with customer

Q4 2021: Previous Owner:

- Billing: $69.01 + $3.45 (Late fee)

- Size: 32gal

- Payment: $37.38 (Service from 10/1—-11/11/2021)

- Contact:

o 11/10/2021: Customer called to cancel service because owner passed away and house sold

Q4 2021: New Owner:

- Billing: bill will go out for Q1 2022 with the billing from 11/15/2021 - 3/31/2021

- Size: 32gal trash

- Payment: $0.00

- Contact:



o 11/10/2021: New owner called to set up the service effective 11/15/2021 as they bought the
property.

Please let me know if there are any further questions. Thank you
Frances

Frances Estrella
Billing Coordinator

4325 66" St E

Inver Grove Heights, Mn 55076
e festrella@republicservices.com
0 651-286-4588

w RepublicServices.com

Qﬂﬁ REPUBLIC

wﬁ SERVICES

We'll handle it from here!

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 20, 2021 5:10 PM

To: Estrella, Frances <FEstrella@republicservices.com>

Cc: Mathiasen, Beverly <BMathiasen@republicservices.com>

Subject: FW: 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Note that (grevering.sph@gmail.com) is an external email. Report suspicious emails by clicking on “Report
Phishing"

Frances,
Please see the information and request below.

Chief Manager
St. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Clare (City of Saint Paul) <support@saintpaul.zendesk.com>

Sent: Monday, December 20, 2021 5:01 PM

To: Consortium <grevering.sph@gmail.com>

Subject: 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107 - (Quarter 3 (July - September)) - Assessment Inquiry

Hello,



We've received an Assessment Inquiry for 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107. Please forward to
Republic Services for their input.

Ticket ID#: 1810

Ticket Requester: Bradley Lara

Ticket Requester Email: (if available)

Ticket Request Phone Number: (if available) +19312413855
Property ID #: 082822230055

Property Address: 593 Humboldt Ave, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55107
Quarter Pending Assessment is for: Quarter 3 (July - September)
Billing year for Pending Assessment: 2021

Pending Assessment Amount: $79.36

Hauler: Republic Services

Ticket Comments: Please provide the following information for Q3 - Q4 2021:

- Iltemized breakdown of invoice
- Payment history
- Contact with property owner

Thank you,

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage

Clare Pillsbury

City of Saint Paul

Department of Public Works - Garbage
651-266-6101
garbage@ci.stpaul.mn.us
https://www.stpaul.gov/garbage




