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#647864 1133 Euclid Street - Q1 2024 Assessment Inquiry

Submitted
July 26, 2024 at 11:59  

Received via
Mail  

Requester
Michelle A. Wigfield <michellewigfield@yahoo.com>

CCs
Jillian Barden <jillian.barden@ci.stpaul.mn.us>, Lydia Campbell <lydia.campbell@ci.stpaul.mn.us>

Status category
Closed  

Ticket status
Solved  

Type
Question  

Priority
Normal  

Group
PW - Garbage  

Assignee
Jillian Barden

Latitude/Longitude
-93.05259,44.95517  

Location
1133 Euclid St, Saint Paul, Minnesota, 55106  

Other Telephone
16515153409

Other Email
michellewigfield@yahoo.com  

Property ID Number
332922420012

Billing period for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
Quarter 1 (January - March)
Billing year for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
2024
Total amount due for Delinquent Garbage Bill Assessment
86.49  

Assessment No.
240114  

Time of LH
3:00 p.m.

Stated Reason for Appeal (if given)
PO paid with money order and submitted receipt to assessment office.  

Date of LH (MM/DD/YYYY)
08/6/2024

Other Name
Michelle
Did you receive a Saint Paul City Council Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment?
No
Garbage Hauler
Waste Management  

Have you contacted your hauler about this garbage bill before?
No

Garbage Invoice Dates (i.e. January 1- March 31)
(January 1 - March 31)
Staff Comments
PO purchased a Money Order on February 10, 2024 in the amount of $85.47 and mailed it to WM. WM cannot
verify or track the Money Order due to lack of a WM stamp. They requested PO retrieve a copy from the
purchase location, but this is impossible as the Money Order was bought in February.

Date of CP (MM/DD/YYYY)
08/21/2024  

Legislative Hearing Required
Yes  

Do you need an interpreter?
No

Project Number
CG2402A2  

Service Level
35 gallons (weekly)

Racquel Naylor July 26, 2024 at 11:59

Garbage Assessment Staff,

Michelle A. Wigfield, 651-515-3409, michellewigfield@yahoo.com, just left my office. She said that she paid her
bill with a money order. See attached copy of the money order receipt.

I set her up for a Legislative Hearing teleconference on Tuesday, August 6, 2024, between 3:00 and 4:00 p.m.
Please call 651-515-3409.
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I told Ms. Wigfield that if a hearing is not needed, she will be called.

Thank you.

Racquel Naylor
Legislative Hearings
Suite 310 City Hall
15 Kellogg Boulevard West
Saint Paul, MN 55102
Phone: 651-266-8585
Fax: 651-266-8574
Front_Desk@ci.stpaul.mn.us_20240726_113547.pdf

Jillian Barden July 26, 2024 at 12:01

Thank you Raquel

I will open a file and see if it can be resolved before the hearing date. If not, I will enter a file in Legistar for her

Jillian

-----Original Message-----

Jillian Barden July 26, 2024 at 12:11

michellewigfield@yahoo.com

Jillian Barden July 31, 2024 at 13:36

Money order is dated 02/10/2024 for the amount of $85.47. WM cannot find it/has no record of it. 
 
WM response" She will have to go back to the location where she purchased that MO and see if she can get a
better copy – as it states “front & back”."

Jillian Barden July 31, 2024 at 13:43

Hi Michelle
 
I have been emailing back and forth with Waste Management to try and figure out what happened to your money
order. They asked if it was possible for you to go back to where you purchased that money order and see if you
can get a copy of the front and back of the money order. It would help them try to located where the payment
went. 
 
The hearing officer will ask for that information as well, at the legislative hearing on August 6, 2024.
 
Let me know if you have any other questions
 
Jillian
Solid Waste

Michelle A. Wigfield July 31, 2024 at 13:56

Hello no, that is not possible. I purchased it in Feb 24.
Thank You

Yahoo Mail: Search, Organize, Conquer

Michelle A. Wigfield July 31, 2024 at 13:59

Also I sent it to City Hall
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Yahoo Mail: Search, Organize, Conquer

Jillian Barden July 31, 2024 at 14:03

Hi Michelle
 
I did receive the copy from City Hall, and I sent that to Waste Management They were hoping you could try and
get a copy of the full Money Order, front and back. I understand it can be difficult because that was quite a while
ago. I am trying to get this figured to prior to the legislative hearing.
 
I will reach out with more info as the date nears.
 
Jillian

Jillian Barden August 2, 2024 at 11:55

Hi Michelle
 
I will enter a file for you for the hearing next Tuesday between 3:00 and 4:00 pm. I will let the Hearing Officer you
will attend by phone.
 
Jillian

Jillian Barden August 6, 2024 at 15:03

I confirmed the Money Order was used to pay for Q4 2023 delinquent garbage hauling
 

Jillian Barden August 6, 2024 at 16:13

Hi Michelle
 
This morning I did some digging and the receipt you brought into our office last week was actually used to pay for
your Quarter 4 (September - December) 2023 bill. You made the payment on February 13, 2024 and it was
cashed by the Saint Paul Assessment Office.
 
Waste Management still has not received payment for Quarter 1 (January - March) 2024, and this is why there is
an assessment due to the City. 
 
Let me know if this clears up any confusion.
 
Jillian
 
 

Michelle A. Wigfield August 8, 2024 at 00:39

Hi Jill, can you just text me the total amount due. Also the address and the attention of.
Thank You,
Michelle Wigfield

Yahoo Mail: Search, Organize, Conquer

Jillian Barden August 8, 2024 at 09:16

Hi Michelle
 
Sure, here is the information.
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Amount Due: $86.49

CITY OF ST PAUL - ASSESSMENTS
700 CITY HALL
15 WEST KELLOGG BOULEVARD
ST PAUL, MN 55102-1658

Let me know if you need anything else

Jillian
Solid Waste

Support Software by Zendesk
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