Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

From: Swanson, Christopher (CI-StPaul)

Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2020 8:26 AM

To: : Pillsbury, Clare (Cl-StPaul)

Subject: ) FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 834 Beech Street Q3 assessment
Attachments: 834 BEECH STREET. Q3 Bill.12-23-2019.pdf

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com [mailto:grevering.sph@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, lanuary 29, 2020 5:30 PM

To: Swanson, Christopher {CI-StPaul) <Christopher.Swanson@cl.stpaul.mn.us>
Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 834 Beech Street Q3 assessment

Think Before Yau Clck. T

Is email originated outside our organization.

Chris,
Please see update from Mary.

Chief Manager
$t. Paul Haulers LLC.

grevering.sph@gmail.com

763-295-2054

From: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com:>

Sent: Wednesday, January 29, 2020 5:28 PM

To; grevering sph@gmail.com

Subject: FW: [EXTERNAL] FW: 834 Beech Street Q3 assessment

Do late charges really show up on a St Paul residents invoice - NO — because they don’t get off cycle billings.
It would have showed up on a past due letter - but I'm not sure if he got one.

Since he was billed on 7.5.19 with payment due on 7.25.19 — we received payment on 8.2.18.

The late charge had been applied on 8.1.19.

Mary Patch

From: grevering.sph@gmail.com <grevering.sph@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, lanuary 29, 2020 5:17 PM

To: Patch, Mary <mpatch@wm.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: 834 Beech Street Q3 assessment

Mary,
Please see attachment and request helow.

Greg Reverning



