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Vang, Mai (CI-StPaul)

From: winstontuannguyen nguyen <winstontuannguyen@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, May 9, 2022 2:28 PM
To: *CI-StPaul_LegislativeHearings
Subject: Fw: Saint Paul Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment
Attachments: IMG_20220306_131958.jpg; IMG_20220306_132200.jpg; IMG_20220306_132202.jpg

 
 
----- Forwarded Message ----- 
From: winstontuannguyen nguyen <winstontuannguyen@yahoo.com> 
To: legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us <legislativehearings@ci.stpaul.mn.us> 
Sent: Saturday, April 30, 2022, 04:14:54 PM CDT 
Subject: Saint Paul Public Hearing Notice Ratification of Assessment 
 
850 University Avenue W. 
Saint Paul, MN 55104 
Dianna Dong Thi Bui  
Parcel ID# 35-29-23-42-0013 
 
file #  J2223A Assessment # 228525 
Dear Sir Madam. I got your notice of ordered  to clean the snow on the front my house side walk , that 
I already shovel snow already.The letter on mail sent  from the city of St Paul came to me to slow. 
Right at that time I called to the officer who  named on the notice ,that I Already clear snow on 
my  side walk already. I always shovel snow right after snow stopped fall.I watch T.V and clear snow 
after snow come.But  
Now I got the proposed assessment letter  from the city of Saint Paul for the assessment of $322.00 
for city of St Paul clear or clean or plow snow, may be they just driver by once, But charged me $ 
322.00, all my neighbors are not charged ,I asked my neighbors they said they are not charged .It is 
not fair to me.Contract or  
St Paul clean snow on my house side  walk for $322.00 dollars that is too much for a little work that I 
already  
done by my self  already I strongly against  this type of scam with little work but charged too much 
money I don't want that work. Please  see my pictures  and  
don't charge me any money for this little work or no work. This is a scam from people you hire them to 
do this  work  but they never do the  work  much but they charged too much. Dear Sir Madam  I live 
here for 
more than 40 years. I always  keep my property clean after snow come , again please see these 
pictures reconsideration with your decision. 
Please don't charged me this amount I am senior, over  84 years old and veteran  thank you . very 
much. 
 
 
                                                                           Dianna Dong Thi Bui  
                                                                                        signed  
 
 
Attached pictures at front house 850 University ave W side walk 
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